REGULATIONS

For information concerning the different types of regulations, see the Information Page.

Symbol Key
Roman type indicates existing text of regulations. Underscored language indicates proposed new text.
Language that has been stricken indicates proposed text for deletion. Brackets are used in final regulations to indicate changes from the
proposed regulation.

TITLE 13. HOUSING
DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

Final Regulation

REGISTRAR'S NOTICE:The Board of Housing and Community Development is claiming an exemption from the
Administrative Act pursuant to 824006 A 13 of the Code of Virginia, hich excludes regulations adopted by the Board of
Housing and Community Development pursuant to the Uniform Statewide Building Cod871&26eq.) provided the board
(i) provides a Notice of Intended Regulatory Action in conformance with the provisiog®.54007.01, (ii) publishes th
proposed regulation and provides an opportunity for oral and written comments as provideedid0§203, and (iii) conduct
at least one public hearing as provided in 88129 and 36L00 prior to the publishing of theroposed regulations.

12Y")

Title of Regulation:13VAC5-63. Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code (amending 13VAC563-10, 13VAC563-20,
13VAC5-63-30, 13VAC563-40, 13VAC563-50, 13VAC563-70, 13VAC563-80, 13VAC563100, 13VAC563-110,
13VAC5-63-120, 13VAC563-130, 13VAC563-150, 13VAC563-160, 13VAC563-190, 13VAC563-200, 13VAC563-210,
13VAC5-63-220, 13VAC563-230, 13VAC563-240, 13VAC563-245, 13VAC563-250, 13VAC563-260, 13VAC563-270,
13VAC5-63-280, 13VAC563-300, 13VAC563-310, 13VAC563-320, 13VAC563-330, 13VAC563-350, 13VAC563-360,
13VAC5-63-400, 13VAC563-430, 13VAC563-434, 13VAC563-436, 13VAC563-437, 13VAC563-438, 13VAC563-440,
13VAC5-63450, 13VAC563-470, 13VAC563-480, 13VAC563490, 13VAC563-500, 13VAC563-520; adding
13VAC5-63-267, 13/AC5-63-335, 13VAC563-525; repealing 13VAC563-225, 13VAC563-265, 13VAC563-432,
13VAC5-63-550).

Statutory Authority’836-98 of the Code of Virginia.
Effective DateMay 1, 2008.

Agency ContactStephen W. Calhoun, Regulatory Coordinator, Departmehtonfsing and Community Development, The
Jackson Center, 501 N. 2nd St., Richmond, VA 232321, telephone 806471-7000, FAX 804371-7090, TTY 804371-
7089, or email steve.calhoun@dhcd.virginia.gov.

Summary:

The amendments to the regulation are categorintmlthree groups. The first group consists of amendments necessary to
incorporate the newest editions of the nationally recognized model codes and standards into the regulation.

The second group of amendments consists of general clarifications anthtonrehanges that are made to more closely
match legislative language, to coordinate the application of the regulations with the other building and fire regulations o
the board, and to remove provisions in the existing Uniform Statewide Building C8@CjUhat have been successfully
added to the latest model codes through the code changes process of the model code organization, thus eliminating the |
for those changes in the USBC.

The third group of amendments consists of changes considered byitteemror client groups to reach a degree of
consensus enabling their inclusion in the proposed regulation. This group of amendments (i) limits the instances whe
building permits can be withheld to the functional design requirements of other depardmagéencies (13VAGBE3-30 L),

(ii) establishes minimum criteria for thirgarty inspector policies of the local building departments (13\AA&8%30 J), (iii)
requires the building owner to request documentation of the existence of violations aftenueecdtinitations time period
expires (13VAC®3150 C) , (iv) changes the time frame for filin
of the code to 30 days for construction issues and 14 days for maintenance issues {63\I8C%E andl3VAC563-500

E), (v) permits bed and breakfaype occupancies having up to 10 occupants total to be classified as afamdie
dwelling (13VAC53-210 F), (vi) maintains the standards for concrete and masonry foundation walls for-fsirmgle
dwellings consistent with the existing provisions instead of using the newest model code provisions-@3YNCEK 22),

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

1



Regulations

(vii) establishes standards for wall bracing in sindgenily dwelling construction (13VAG&E3-210 K 28), (vii)) removes a
prohibition fromthe use of plumbing drainage piping in exposed ceiling areas in food service establishments {63VAC5
320 B), and (ix) establishes standards for the construction of public swimming pools.

Changes in the final regulation are the result of proposals stéanét the public hearing and during the comment periods
established by the Board of Housing and Community Development. Proposals were received from numerous client groups
and interested parties including the Virginia Building and Code Officials Assogjatite Virginia Plumbing and
Mechanical Inspectors Association, the Virginia Chapter of the International Association of Electrical Inspectors, the Home
Builders Association of Virginia, the Virginia Chapter of the American Institute of Architects, thdnBuand Office
Managers Association, the National Apartment Managers Association, the Virginia Fire Prevention Association and many
trade associations. The Board of Housing and Community Development established a number of work groups to analyze the
proposals and determine the degree of consensus each proposal achieved among the interest groups.

Substantial changes made in the final regulation are as follows:

1. Clarify the requirements for when permits are necessary for alterations to existing buildahgding an allowance for
building officials to require permits for replacement siding, roofing and windows in historic districts (138»&bA and
B);

2. Provide criteria for classifying small bed and breakfasts in the same occupancy classificatinglesamily dwellings
(13VAC563-210 E);

3. Amend the requirements for wall bracing in the proposed regulation with requirements developed at the national level
that will be contained in the 2009 International Residential Code (13V88=5L0 J 36;

4. Madify the 2006 International Residential Code requirement for the height of window sills from a minimum of 24 inches
above the floor to a minimum of 18 inches above the floor (13V68<3.0 J 37);

5. Modify the International Residential Code requirementgHe installation of a specialized type of gas piping known as
CSST, which has been shown to be susceptible to lightning strikes and add a new requirement for the isolation of liquefied
petroleum gas piping where entering a building (13VA3210 J 42 ad 43);

6. Establish new minimum requirements fobinlding emergency communication equipment in buildings of construction
types that may block transmission of signals (13\&&240 N, O, P and Q);

7. Clarify the site requirements for installation of méactured homes in parks to mirror federal requirements (13VA&ES5
270 B);

8. Establish criteria for the use of special inspectors for more critical types of construction to provide guidance to local
building officials in approving such inspections (13VA&3280 A, B, C and E);

9. Clarify that emergency generators installed to meet requirements for assisted living facilities may be considered optional
standby systems instead of having to meet provisions for legally required systems (B3300D);

10. Replace the mechanical ventilation requirements of the International Mechanical Code (IMC) with requirements based
on a national standard for heating and -@onditioning approved at the national level for the 2009 IMC (13888310 E
2 and 3);

11. Add a equirement for tracer wire to be installed with sewer piping (13888320 B 5);

12. Add minimum requirements for the installation of machamenless elevators to assure the maintenance of the units
can be conducted without structural modifications &mgrovide for safe installations (13VA@&3-330 B);

13. Clarify that an owner may choose to demolish an unsafe building rather than correcting the deficienciesg348C5
A); and

14. Retain requirements of the 2003 International Property Maintenande @ the numbers of occupants permitted in
residential occupancies (13VA@&3-525 B and C).

Summary of Public Comments and Agency's Respdhsemmary of comments made by the public and the agency's response
may be obtained from the promulgating ageocyiewed at the office of the Registrar of Regulations.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

2



Regulations

Part |
Construction

13VAC5-63-10. Chapter 1 Administration; Section 101 General.

A. Section 101.1 Short title. The Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code, Part I, Construction, may be tited/aginia
Construction Code. The term "USBC" shall mean the Virginia Construction Code unless the context in which the term is us
clearly indicates it to be an abbreviation for the entire Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code or for a diffetarittpar
Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code.

B. Section 101.2 Incorporation by reference. Chapter82 of the20032006 International Building Code, published by the
International Code Council, Inc., are adopted and incorporated by referencanoehérceable part of the USBC. The term
"IBC" means the2003 2006 International Building Code, published by the International Code Council, Inc. Any codes and
standards referenced in the IBC are also considered to be part of the incorporation byereéaapt that such codes and
standards are used only to the prescribed extent of each such reference. In addition, any provisions of the apperi&@€es of the
specifically identified to be part of the USBC are also considered to be part of the indgorpbyateference.

Note 1: The IBC references the whole family of International Codes including the following major codes:
20032006International Plumbing Code
20032006International Mechanical Code
20022005National Electrical Code
20032006Internatioral Fuel Gas Code
20032006International Energy Conservation Code
20032006International Residential Code

Note 2: The International Residential Code is applicable to the construction of detacheghdrtevefamily dwellings and
townhouses as set out$ection 310.

C. Section 101.3 Numbering system. A dual numbering system is used in the USBC to correlate the numbering system of
Virginia Administrative Code with the numbering system of the IBC. IBC numbering system designations are provided in th
cachlines of the Virginia Administrative Code sections. Cross references between sections or chapters of the USBC use o
the IBC numbering system designations. The term "chapter" is used in the context of the numbering system of the IBC and r
mean a chater in the USBC, a chapter in the IBC or a chapter in a referenced code or standard, depending on the context of
use of the term. The term "chapter" is not used to designate a chapter of the Virginia Administrative Code, unless clea
indicated.

D. Section 101.4 Arrangement of code provisions. The USBC is comprised of the combination of (i) the provisions of Chapt:
1, Administration, which are established herein, (ii) Chapter82of the IBC, which are incorporated by reference in Section
101.2, ad (iii) the changes to the text of the incorporated chapters of the IBC that are specifically identified. The terminolog
"changes to the text of the incorporated chapters of the IBC that are specifically identified" shall also be referned'stags t
amendments to the IBC." Such state amendments to the IBC are set out using corresponding chapter and section humbers
IBC numbering system. In addition, since Chapter 1 of the IBC is not incorporated as part of the USBC, any reference fc
provision of Chapter 1 of the IBC in the provisions of Chapters3® of the IBC is generally invalid. However, where the
purpose of such a reference would clearly correspond to a provision of Chapter 1 established herein, then the refeeence ma
construed to & a valid reference to such corresponding Chapter 1 provision.

E. Section 101.5 Use of terminology and notes. The term "this code," or "the code," where used in the provisions of Chapte
in Chapters 2 35 of the IBC or in the state amendments to th€ iBeans the USBC, unless the context clearly indicates
otherwise. The term "this code" or "the code" where used in a code or standard referenced in the IBC means that codke
standard, unless the context clearly indicates otherwise. The use of noteptier Cha to provide information only and shall
not be construed as changing the meaning of any code provision. Notes in the IBC, in the codes and standards referenced i
IBC and in the state amendments to the IBC may modify the content of a relaesioprand shall be considered to be a valid
part of the provision, unless the context clearly indicates otherwise.

F. Section 101.6 Order of precedence. The provisions of Chapter 1 of this code supersede any conflicting provisions
Chapters 2 35 of he IBC and any conflicting provisions of the codes and standards referenced in the IBC. In addition, the

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

3



Regulations

state amendments to the IBC supersede any conflicting provisions of Chap8&®Rthe IBC and any conflicting provisions
of the codes and standardeferenced in the IBC. Further, the provisions of Chapters32 of the IBC supersede any
conflicting provisions of the codes and standards referenced in the IBC.

G. Section 101.7 Administrative provisions. The provisions of Chapter 1 establish adhtii@stequirements, which include
but are not limited to provisions relating to the scope of the code, enforcement, fees, permits, inspections and disputes. An
provisions of Chapters 235 of the IBC or any provisions of the codes and standards reéerém¢he IBC that address the
same subject matter and impose differing requirements are deleted and replaced by the provisions of Chapter 1. Further, any
administrative requirements contained in the state amendments to the IBC shall be given the sal@ecpras the provisions
of Chapter 1. Notwithstanding the above, where administrative requirements of Chap3éref2the IBC or of the codes and
standards referenced in the IBC are specifically identified as valid administrative requirements in Clo&piés code or in
the state amendments to the IBC, then such requirements are not deleted and replaced.

Note: The purpose of this provision is to eliminate overlap, conflicts and duplication by providing a single standard for
administrative, procedat and enforcement requirements of this code.

H. Section 101.8 Definitions. The definitions of terms used in this code are contained in Chapter 2 along with specific
provisions addressing the use of definitions. Terms may be defined in other chaptessisions of the code and such
definitions are also valid.

Note: The order of precedence outlined in Section 101.6 may be determinative in establishing how to apply the definitions in
the IBC and in the referenced codes and standards.

13VAC5-63-20. Sectionl02 Purpose and scope.

A. Section 102.1 Purpose. In accordance with-836f the Code of Virginia, the purpose of the USBC is to protect the
health, safety and welfare of the residents of the Commonwealth of Virginia, provided that buildings anckstshotld be
permitted to be constructed at the least possible cost consistent with recognized standards of health, safety, enat@nconserv
and water conservation, including provisions necessary to prevent overcrowding, rodent or insect infesthtianbage
accumulation; and barridree provisions for the physically handicapped and aged.

B. Section 102.2 Scope. This section establishes the scope of the USBC in accordance-98tlof8B@& Code of Virginia.
The USBC shall supersede the buildingle® and regulations of the counties, municipalities and other political subdivisions
and state agencies. This code also shall supersede the provisions of local ordinances applicabldamilingsidential
construction that (i) regulate dwelling fouatébns or crawl spaces, (ii) require the use of specific building materials or finishes
in construction, or (iii) require minimum surface area or numbers of windows; however, this code shall not supersedke proffere
conditions accepted as a part of a remgrapplication, conditions imposed upon the grant of special exceptions, special or
conditional use permits or variances, conditions imposed upon a clustering offamglehomes and preservation of open
space development through standards, conditanmd criteria established by a locality pursuant to subdivision 8 of 2312
of the Code of Virginia or subdivision A 12 of 815286 of the Code of Virginia, or land use requirements in airport or
highway overlay districts, or historic districts crehtgursuant to 815-2306 of the Code of Virginia, or local flood plain
regulations adopted as a condition of participation in the National Flood Insurance Program.

Note: Requirements relating to functional design are contained in Section 103.11 of ¢his cod

C. Section 102.2.1 Invalidity of provisions. To the extent that any provisions of this code are in conflict with Chapéer 6 (8
97 et seq.) of Title 36 of the Code of Virginia or in conflict with the scope of the USBC, those provisions are consluered to
invalid to the extent of such conflict.

D. Section 102.3 Exemptions. The following are exempt from this code:

1. Equipment and related wiring installed by a provider of publicly regulated utility service or a franchised cablentelevisio
operator and ektrical equipment and related wiring used for radio, broadcast or cable television, telecommunications or
information service transmission. The exemption shall apply only if under applicable federal and state law the ownership and
control of the equipmerdnd wiring is by the service provider or its affiliates. Such exempt equipment and wiring shall be
located on either public rightsf-way or private property for which the service provider has rights of occupancy and entry;
however, the structures, incing their service equipment, housing or supporting such exempt equipment and wiring shall be
subject to the USBC. The installation of equipment and wiring exempted by this section shall not create an unsafe condition
prohibited by the USBC.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

4



Regulations

2. Manufacturig and processing machines, including all of the following service equipment associated with the
manufacturing or processing machines.

2.1. Electrical equipment connected after the last disconnecting means.

2.2. Plumbing piping and equipment connected dfterlast shutoff valve or backflow device and before the equipment
drain trap.

2.3. Gas piping and equipment connected after the outlet shutoff valve.
3. Parking lots and sidewalks, which are not part of an accessible route.

4. RecreatiohaNonmechanizeglayground or recreationaquipment such as swing sets, sliding boards, climbing bars,

jungle gyms, skateboard ramps, and similar equiprdr@n-—such—equipmentis—hot-regulated-by-the VVADRere no

admission fee is charged for its use or for admittaneegas where the equipment is located

5. Industrialized buildingssubject to the Virginia Industrialized Building Safety Regqulations (13VACH and

manufactured homes subject to the V|rqm|a Manufactured Home Safetv Regulations (}SBA@Scept—the—a;phealele

# 6. Farm buildings and structures, except for a building or a portion of a building located on a farm that is operated as
restaurant as defined in 838L1of the Code bVirginia and licensed as such by the Virginia Board of Health pursuant to
Chapter 2 (835-11 et seq.) of Title 35.1 of the Code of Virginia. However, farm buildings and structures lying within a
flood plain or in a mudslid@rone area shall be subjectftood-proofing regulations or mudslide regulations, as applicable.

13VAC5-63-30. Section 103 Application of code.

A. Section 103.1 General. In accordance with-896f the Code of Virginia, the USBC shall prescribe building regulations
to be complied vth in the construction and rehabilitation of buildings and structures, and the equipment therein.

B. Section 103.2 When applicable to new construction. Construction for which a permit application is submitted to the loc
building department aftalevembe-16,2005 {insert-effective-dateMay 1, 2008, shall comply with the provisions of this
code, except for permit applications submitted during ay@ae period afteNevember16,200p {insert-effective-dateMay
1, 2008]. The applicant for a permiduring such ongear period shall be permitted to choose whether to comply with the
provisions of this code or the provisions of the code in effect immediately pridavtember-16.-2005 {insert-effective-date)

May 1, 2008. This provision shall alsopply to subsequent amendments to this code based on the effective date of suct
amendments. In addition, when a permit has been properly issued under a previous edition of this code, this code shall
require changes to the approved construction documeessgn or construction of such a building or structure, provided the
permit has not been suspended or revoked.

C. Section 103.3 Change of occupancy. No change shall be made in the existing occupancy classification of any struct
when the current USBCequires a greater degree of structural strength, fire protection, means of egress, ventilation ¢
sanitation. When such a greater degree is required, the owner or the owner's agent shall make written applicatior to the I
building department for a nevenificate of occupancy and shall obtain the new certificate of occupancy prior to the use of the
structure under the new occupancy classification. When impractical to achieve compliance with this code for the ne
occupancy classification, the building iofél shall consider modifications upon application and as provided for in Section
106.3.

Exception: This section shall not be construed to permit nhoncompliance with any applicable flood load-mrsfkiadt
construction requirements of this code.

D. Section 103.4 Additions. Additions to buildings and structures shall comply with the requirements of this code for new
construction and an existing building or structure plus additions shall comply with the height and area provisions 05.Chapter
Further, his code shall not require changes to the design or construction of any portions of the building or structure not alter
or affected by an addition, unless the addition has the effect of lowering the current level of safety.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

5



Regulations

Exception: This section shatiot be construed to permit noncompliance with any applicable flood load orrés@dant
construction requirements of this code.

E. Section 103.5 Reconstruction, alteration or repair. The following criteria is applicable to reconstruction, alterapiain or

of buildings or structuresgrovided-the

1. Any] reconstruction, alteration or repaidgesshall] not adversely affect the performance of the building or structure,
[ or] cause the building or structure to become unsafe or lower existielg lefvhealth and safety.

[ + 2.] Parts of the building or structure not being reconstructed, altered or repaired shall not be required to comply with the
requirements of this code applicable to newly constructed buildings or structures.

[ 2 3.] The irstallation of material or equipment, or both, that is neither required nor prohibited shall only be required to
comply with the provisions of this code relating to the safe installation of such material or equipment.

[ 3-4.] Material or equipment, or blot may be replaced in the same location with material or equipment of a similar kind or
capacity.

[ ExeeptionExceptiony:

[ 1.] This section shall not be construed to permit noncompliance with any applicable flood load ereflistaht
construction rquirements of this code.

[ 2. Reconstructed decks, balconies, porches and similar structures located 30 inches (762 mm) or more above grade shall
meet the current code provisions for structural loading capacity, connections and structural attachmesquiféiisent
excludes handrails and guardrajls.

F. Section 103.6. Use of rehabilitation code. Compliance with Part Il of the Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code, also
known as the "Virginia Rehabilitation Code,” shall be an acceptable alternaticentpliance with this code for the
rehabilitation of such existing buildings and structures within the scope of that code. For the purposes of this seetion, the
"rehabilitation” shall be as defined in the Virginia Rehabilitation Code.

G. Section 103.7Retrofit requirements. The local building department shall enforce the provisions of Section 3411, which
require certain existing buildings to be retrofitted with fire protection systems and other safety equipment. Retr@active fir
protection system req@ments contained in the International Fire Code shall not be applicable unless required for compliance
with the provisions of Section 3411.

H. Section 103.8 Nonrequired equipment. The following criteria for nonrequired equipment is in accordance-MtB 8836
the Code of Virginia. Building owners may elect to install partial or full fire alarms or other safety equipment that was not
required by the edition of the USBC in effect at the time a building was constructed without meeting current requifements o
the code, provided the installation does not create a hazardous condition. Permits for installation shall be obtained in
accordance with this code. In addition, as a requirement of this code, when such nonrequired equipment is to be &stalled, th
building official shall notify the appropriate fire official or fire chief.

I. Section 103.8.1 Reduction in function or discontinuance of nonrequired fire protection systems. When a nonrequired fire
protection system is to be reduced in function or discontinitisdall be done in such a manner so as not to create a false sense
of protection. Generally, in such cases, any features visible from interior areas shall be removed, such as sprinkteokeads,
detectors or alarm panels or devices, but any wiringiping hidden within the construction of the building may remain.
Approval of the proposed method of reduction or discontinuance shall be obtained from the building official.

J. Section 103.9 Equipment changes. Upon the replacement or new installatigrfuggHourning appliances or equipment in
existing buildings, an inspection or inspections shall be conducted to ensure that the connected vent or chimney systems
comply with the following:

1. Vent or chimney systems are sized in accordance with eiteeintbrnational Residential Code, the International
Mechanical Code or the International Fuel Gas Code, depending on which is applicable based on the fuel source and the
occupancy classification of the structure.

2. Vent or chimney systems are clean, fodeany obstruction or blockages, defects or deterioration and are in operable
condition.

Where not inspected by the local building department, persons performing such changes or installations shall certify to the
building official that the requirements iEms 1 and 2 of this section are met.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

6



Regulations

K. Section 103.10 Use of certain provisions of referenced codes. The following provisions of the IBC and of other indicate
codes or standards are to be considered valid provisions of this code. Where any sudngroais been modified by the
state amendments to the IBC, then the modified provisions apply.

1. Special inspection requirements in Chapter82

2. Chapter 34, Existing Structures, except that Section 3410, Compliance Alternatives, shall not beasgtytwith the
retrofit requirements identified in Section 103.7 and shall not be construed to permit noncompliance with any applicab
flood load or floodresistant construction requirements of this code.

3. Testing requirements and requirements ferghbmittal of construction documents in any of the ICC codes referenced in
Chapter 35.

4. Section R301.2 of the International Residential Code authorizing localities to determine climatic and geographic desi
criteria.

5. Flood load or floodesistant costruction requirements in the IBC or the International Residential Code, including, but not
limited to, any such provisions pertaining to flood elevation certificates that are located in Chapter 1 of those codes. Al
required flood elevation certificataupsuant to such provisions shall be prepared by a land surveyor licensed in Virginia or
an RDP.

L. Section 103.11 Functional design. The following criteria for functional design is in accordance w@8 §Bthe Code of
Virginia. The USBC shall not supade the regulations of other state agencies that require and govern the functional desig
and operation of building related activities not covered by the USBC, including but not limited to (i) public water supply
systems, (ii) waste water treatment ansbdsal systems, (iii) solid waste facilities, nor shall state agencies be prohibited from
requiring, pursuant to other state law, that buildings and equipment be maintained in accordance with provisions oflthis code
addition, as established by this epdhe building official may refuse to issue a permit until the applicant has supplied
certificates of functional design approval from the appropriate state agency or agencies. For purposes of coordination,
locality may require reports to the buildirgfficial by other departmentsr agencies indicating compliance with their
regulations applicable to the functional design of a building or struetsir@ condition for issuance of a building permit or
certificate of occupancy. Such reports shall be baped review of the plans or inspection of the project as determined by the
locality. All enforcement of these conditions shall not be the responsibility of the building official, but rather the agency
imposing the condition.

Note: Identified state agenci@sgth functional design approval are listed in the "Related Laws Package," which is available
from DHCD.

M. Section 103.12 Amusement devices and inspections. In accordance wii8.836f the Code of Virginia, to the extent
they are not superseded by fivevisions of §38.3 of the Code of Virginia and the VADR, the provisions of the USBC shall
apply to amusement devices. In addition, as a requirement of this code, inspections for compliance with the VADR shall
conducted either by local building depraent personnel or private inspectors provided such persons are certified as amusemer
device inspectors under the VCS.

N. Section 103.13 State buildings and structures. This section establishes the application of the USB&@wmestate
buildings and strctures in accordance with §88.1 of the Code of Virginia. The USBC shall be applicable to all-statesd
buildings and structures, with the exception that §8§229, 2.21160 and 2.2161 of the Code of Virginia shall provide the
standards for ready eess to and use of state/ned buildings by the physically handicapped.

Any stateowned building or structure for which preliminary plans were prepared or on which construction commenced afte
the initial effective date of the USBC, shall remain subje¢héoprovisions of the USBC that were in effect at the time such
plans were completed or such construction commenced. Subsequent reconstruction, renovation or demolition of such builc
or structure shall be subject to the pertinent provisions of this.cod

Acting through the Division of Engineering and Buildings, the Virginia Department of General Services shall function as th
building official for stateowned buildings. The department shall review and approve plans and specifications, grant
modificatiors, and establish such rules and regulations as may be necessary to implement this section. It shall provide for
inspection of statewned buildings and enforcement of the USBC and standards for access by the physically handicapped |
delegating inspein and USBC enforcement duties to the State Fire Marshal's Office, to other appropriate state agencit
having needed expertise, and to local building departments, all of which shall provide such assistance within a reasonable t
and in the manner requed. State agencies and institutions occupying buildings shall pay to the local building department th

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

7



Regulations

same fees as would be paid by a private citizen for the services rendered when such services are requested by the department.
The department may alter overrule any decision of the local building department after having first considered the local
building department's report or other rationale given for its decision. When altering or overruling any decision of a local
building department, the departmehiall provide the local building department with a written summary of its reasons for doing

So.

Notwithstanding any provision of this code to the contrary, roadway tunnels and bridges owned by the Virginia Department of
Transportation shall be exempt frairis code. The Virginia Department of General Services shall not have jurisdiction over
such roadway tunnels, bridges and other limited access highways; provided, however, that the Department of General Services
shall have jurisdiction over any occupiedildings within any Department of Transportation righfsvay that are subject to
this code.

Except as provided in §233.109 D of the Code of Virginia, and notwithstanding any provision of this code to the contrary, at
the request of a public institutiaf higher education, the Virginia Department of General Services, as further set forth in this
provision, shall authorize that institution of higher education to contract with a building official of the locality in tivaich
construction is taking place fperform any inspection and certifications required for the purpose of complying with this code.
The department shall publish administrative procedures that shall be followed in contracting with a building official of the
locality. The authority grantea ta public institution of higher education under this provision to contract with a building official
of the locality shall be subject to the institution meeting the conditions prescribed-8888B of the Code of Virginia.

Note: In accordance with §38.1 of the Code of Virginia, roadway tunnels and bridges shall be designed, constructed and
operated to comply with fire safety standards based on nationally recognized model codes and standaedskspbeent
developedby the Virginia Department of @&nsportation in consultation with the State Fire Marshal and approved by the
Virginia Commonwealth Transportation Board. Emergency response planning and activities related to the standards approved
by the Commonwealth Transportation Board shall be develbgehe Department of Transportation and coordinated with the
appropriate local officials and emergency service providers. On an annual basis, the Department of Transportationdghall provi
a report on the maintenance and operability of installed fireegiion and detection systems in roadway tunnels and bridges to
the State Fire Marshal.

13VAC5-63-40. Section 104 Enforcement, generally.

A. Section 104.1 Scope of enforcement. This section establishes the requirements for enforcement of the USB&riceaccor
with §36-105 of the Code of Virginia. Enforcement of the provisions of the USBC for construction and rehabilitation shall be
the responsibility of the local building department. Whenever a county or municipality does not have such a building
departmet, the local governing body shall enter into an agreement with the local governing body of another county or
municipality or with some other agency, or a state agency approved by DHCD for such enforcement. For the purposes of this
section, towns with a galation of less than 3,500 may elect to administer and enforce the USBC; however, where the town
does not elect to administer and enforce the code, the county in which the town is situated shall administer and enftece the
for the town. In the evenush town is situated in two or more counties, those counties shall administer and enforce the USBC
for that portion of the town that is situated within their respective boundaries.

Upon a finding by the local building department, following a conmplly a tenant of a residential rental unit that is the
subject of such complaint, that there may be a violation of the unsafe structures provisiEnsaafe Part 11l of the Virginia

Uniform Statewide Building Code, also known as the "Virginia MainteraCode,the local building department shall enforce
such provisions.

If the local building department receives a complaint that a violation a§8RC Virginia Maintenance Codexists that is an
immediate and imminent threat to the health or safetyhefowner or tenant of a residential dwelling unit or a nearby
residential dwelling unit, and the owner or tenant of the residential dwelling unit that is the subject of the compiafinsérhs
to allow the local building official or his agent to hawecess to the subject dwelling, the local building official or his agent
may present sworn testimony to a court of competent jurisdiction and request that the court grant the local buildiry official
his agent an inspection warrant to enable the buildiffigial or his agent to enter the subject dwelling for the purpose of
determining whether violations of th¢SBC Virginia Maintenance Codexist. The local building official or his agent shall
make a reasonable effort to obtain consent from the ownenant of the subject dwelling prior to seeking the issuance of an
inspection warrant under this section.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

8



Regulations

local governing body shall inspect and enforce the provisions of the Virginia Maintenance Code for elevato?except f
elevators in single and twiamily homesand townhouses. Such inspection and enforcement shall be carried out by an agenc
or department designated by the local governing body.

include
bdivision- ental
Ai bj a rents

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

9



Regulations

3 da 0 d may, in
4 s a abo Dro e s 1 d ed rental
section : e be identi Droperty omgiance wit

3 s 3 inance for
ion B : pitary living

vided above,
he-last four
ertificate of

G B. Section 104.2 Interagency coordination. When any inspection functions under this code are assigned to a local agency
other than the local building department, such agency shall coordinate its reports of inspection with the &ngl buil
department.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

10



Regulations

B C. 104.3 Transfer of ownership. If the local building department has initiated an enforcement action against the owner of
building or structure and such owner subsequently transfers the ownership of the building or structuratjoimnveith the
owner holds an ownership interest greater than 50%, the pending enforcement action shall continue to be enforced agains
owner.

[ 13VAC5-63-50. Section 105 Local building department.

A. Section 105.1 Appointment of building officigEvery local building department shall have a building official as the
executive official in charge of the department. The building official shall be appointed in a manner selected by the loc
governing body. After permanent appointment, the buildingieffishall not be removed from office except for cause after
having been afforded a full opportunity to be heard on specific and relevant charges by and before the appointing author
DHCD shall be notified by the appointing authority within 30 dayshef appointment or release of a permanent or acting
building official.

Note: Building officials are subject to sanctions in accordance with the VCS.

B. Section 105.1.1 Qualifications of building official. The building official shall have at least five géhauilding experience
as a licensed professional engineer or architect, building, fire or trade inspector, contractor, housing inspectortendenterin
of building, fire or trade construction or at least five years of building experience aftemiogptai degree in architecture or
engineering, with at least three years in responsible charge of work. Any combination of education and experience that wo
confer equivalent knowledge and ability shall be deemed to satisfy this requirement. The lmffldiagshall have general
knowledge of sound engineering practice in respect to the design and construction of structures, the basic principles of
prevention, the accepted requirements for means of egress and the installation of elevators asetvatbeequipment
necessary for the health, safety and general welfare of the occupants and the public. The local governing body may estal
additional qualification requirements.

C. Section 105.1.2 Certification of building official. An acting or pemera building official shall be certified as a building
official in accordance with the VCS within one year after being appointed as acting or permanent building official.

Exception: A building official in place prior to April 1, 1983, shall not be rezpliito meet the certification requirements in
this section while continuing to serve in the same capacity in the same locality.

D. Section 105.1.3 Noncertified building official. Except for a building official exempt from certification under the ercepti
to Section 105.1.2, any acting or permanent building official who is not certified as a building official in accordartbe with
VCS shall attend the core module of the Virginia Building Code Academy or an equivalent course in an individual or region:
coce academy accredited by DHCD within 180 days of appointment. This requirement is in addition to meeting the certificatic
requirement in Section 105.1.2.

E. Section 105.1.4 Continuing education requirements. Building officials shall dtéehdurs everywo years of continuing
education angberiodic training coursesdesignatedpproved or requirebdy DHCD. Additional continuing education hours shall
not be required if more than one certificate is held.

F. Section 105.2 Technical assistants. The buildiffigial, subject to any limitations imposed by the locality, shall be
permitted to utilize technical assistants to assist the building official in the enforcement of the USBC. DHCD shaikebe notif
by the building official within 60 days of the employmefif contracting with or termination of all technical assistants.

Note: Technical assistants are subject to sanctions in accordance with the VCS.

G. Section 105.2.1 Qualifications of technical assistants. A technical assistant shall have at leasrhofeeyperience and
general knowledge in at least one of the following areas: building construction; building, fire or housing inspectiomsgplumb
electrical or mechanical trades; or fire protection, elevator or property maintenance work. Any tomloihaducation and
experience that would confer equivalent knowledge and ability shall be deemed to satisfy this requirement. The locality m
establish additional qualification requirements.

H. Section 105.2.2 Certification of technical assistanttedhnical assistant shall be certified in the appropriate subject area
within 18 months after becoming a technical assistant. When required by local policy to have two or more certifications,
technical assistant shall obtain the additional certificatigitisin three years from the date of such requirement.

Exception: A technical assistant in place prior to March 1, 1988, shall not be required to meet the certification regjiirement
this section while continuing to serve in the same capacity in the kmality.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

11



Regulations

I. Section 105.2.3 Continuing education requirements. Technical assistants shall &ttennls every two years of continuing
education angeriodic training coursesdesignatedpproved or requireby DHCD. Additional continuing education hosishall
not be required if more than one certificate is held.

J. Section 105.3 Conflict of interest. The standards of conduct for building officials and technical assistants shall be in
accordance with the provisions of the State and Local GovernmeniidConfnterests Act, Chapter 31 (823100 et seq.) of
Title 2.2 of the Code of Virginia.

K. Section 105.4 Records. The local building department shall retain a record of applications received, permits, ¢ertificates
notices and orders issued, fees extikd and reports of inspection in accordance with The Library of Virginia's General
Schedule Number Six. ]

[ 13VAC5-63-70. Section 107 Fees.

A. Section 107.1 Authority for charging fees. In accordance with18860f the Code of Virginia, fees may beitd by the
local governing body in order to defray the cost of enforcement of the USBC.

B. Section 107.1.1 Fee schedule. The local governing body shall establish a fee schedule incorporating unit rates, which may
be based on square footage, cubic foqtagimated cost of construction or other appropriate criteria. A permit or any
amendments to an existing permit shall not be issued until the designated fees have been paid, except that the hallding offic
may authorize the delayed payment of fees.

C. Section 107.1.2 Refunds. When requested in writing by a permit holder, the locality shall provide a fee refund in the case of
the revocation of a permit or the abandonment or discontinuance of a building project. The refund shall not be required to
exceedan amount which correlates to work not completed.

D. Section 107.2 Code academy fee levy. In accordance with subdivision 7-aBg38f the Code of Virginia, the local
building department shall collect a 1.75% levy of fees charged for building persutdisinder this code and transmit it
quarterly to DHCD to support training programs of the Virginia Building Code Acadéhw.foregoing levy shall remain
effective until July 1, 2009, after which time the fee levy shall be increased to Pdd#lities ttat maintain individual or
regional training academies accredited by DHCD shall retain such]levy.

[ 13VACS5-63-80. Section 108 Application for permit.

A. Section 108.1 When applications are required. Application for a permit shall be made to the bfficiedgand a permit
shall be obtained prior to the commencement of any of the following activities, except that applications for emergency
construction, alterations or equipment replacement shall be submitted by the end of the first working ddgwisathfolday
such work commences. In addition, the building official may authorize work to commence pending the receipt of an application
or the issuance of a permit.

1. Construction or demolition of a building or structire z
the-USBC Installations or alterations involving (i) the removal or add|t|on of any wall, partmon or portlon thereof, (ii) any
structural component, (iii) the repair or replacement of any required component ®fast §moke rated assembly, (iv) the
alteration of any required means of egress system, (v) water supply and distribution system, sanitary drainage system or vent
system, (vi) electric wiring, (vii) fire protection system, mechanical systems, or fuel sygtms, or (viii) any equipment
regulated by the USBC.

2. For change of occupancy, application for a permit shall be made when a new certificate of occupancy is required under
Section 103.3.

2. 3. Movement of a lot line that increases the hazard teeoredses the level of safety of an existing building or structure in
comparison to the building code under which such building or structure was constructed.

3. 4. Removal or disturbing of any asbestos containing materials during the construction otiderobla building or
structure, including additions.

B. Section 108.2 Exemptions from application for permit. Notwithstanding the requirements of Section 108.1, application for
a permit and any related inspections shall not be required for the follolomggver, this section shall not be construed to
exempt such activities from other applicable requirements of this code. In addition, when an owner or an owner's atgent reques
that a permit be issued for any of the following, then a permit shall be issdeghy related inspections shall be required.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

12



Regulations

1. Installation of wiring and equipment that (i) operates at less than 50 volts, (ii) is for network powered broadban
communications systems, or (iii) is exempt under Section 102.3(1), except when anpssalidtions are located in a
plenum, penetrate fire rated or smoke protected construction or are a component of any of the following:

1.1. Fire alarm system.

1.2. Fire detection system.

1.3. Fire suppression system.

1.4. Smoke control system.

1.5. Hre protection supervisory system.

1.6. Elevator fire safety control system.

1.7. Access or egress control system or delayed egress locking or latching system.
1.8. Fire damper.

1.9. Door control system.

2. Detached accessory structures used as mabstrage sheds, playhouses or similar uses, provided the floor area does nof
exceed 150 square feet (14)rand the structures are not accessory to a Group F or H occupancy.

3. Detached prefabricated buildings housing the equipment of a publicly exhuiity service, provided the floor area
does not exceed 150 square feet (T m

4. Tents or aksupported structures, or both, that cover an area of 900 square fe€)) @dless, including within that area
all connecting areas or spaces with a swn means of egress or entrance, provided such tents or structures have ar
occupant load of 50 or less persons.

5. Fences and privacy walls not part of a building, structure or of the barrier for a swimming pool, provided such fences a
privacy walls donot exceed six feet in height above the finished grade. Ornamental post caps shall not be considered
contribute to the height of the fence or privacy wall and shall be permitted to extend above the six feet height measuremer

6. Retaining walls suppting less than two feet of unbalanced fill. This exemption shall not apply to any wall impounding
Class I, Il or llIFA liquids or supporting a surcharge other than ordinary unbalanced fill.

7. Swimming pools that have a surface area not greater thamadafdeet (13.95 H do not exceed 5,000 gallons (19 000
L) and are less than 24 inches (610 mm) deep.

9. 8. Signs under the conditions Section H101.2 of Appendix H.

10. 9. Replacement of abowground existing LRyas containers of the same capacity in the same location and associated
regulators when installed by the serving gas supplier.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

13



Regulations

10. Ordinary repairs that include the following:

10.1. Replacement of windows and doors that are not required to be fire rated in GPowpheRe serving a single
dwelling unit and in GroupsR, R4 and R5.

10.2. Replacement of plumbing fixtures in all groups without alteration of the water sugbldisinbution systems,
sanitary drainage systems or vent systems.

10.3. Replacement of general use snap switches, dimmer and control switches, 1IZ5oroR0 ampere receptacles,
luminaries (lighting fixtures) and ceiling (paddle) fans in Group ®Rhee serving a single dwelling unit and in Groups R
3, R4 and R5.

10.4. Replacement of mechanical appliances provided such equipment is not fueled by gas or oil in-ZmlierdR
serving a single family dwelling and in Groups3RR-4 and R5.

10.5. Replaement of an unlimited amount of roof covering or siding in Grou® R4 or R5 provided the building or
structure is not in an area where the design (3 second gust) wind speed is greater than 100 miles per hour (160 km/hr) and
replacement of 100 squdieet (9.29 rf) or less of roof covering in all groups and all wind zones.

10.6. Replacement of 100 square feet (9.2panless of roof decking in Groups® R-4 or R5 unless the decking to be
replaced was required at the time or original constructiohet fireretardanttreated or protected in some other way to
form a firerated wall termination.

10.7. Installation or replacement of floor finishes in all occupancies.

10.8. Replacement of Class C interior wall or ceiling finishes installed in GroupsaAd | and replacement of all classes
of interior wall or ceiling finishes in other groups.

10.9. Installation of replacement cabinetry or trim.

10.10. Application of paint or wallpaper.

10.11. Other repair work deemed by the building official to be mamok ordinary which does not adversely affect public
health or general safety.

Exception: Application for a permit may be required by the building official for the installation of replacement sidiimg; roof
and windows in buildings within a historic distrdesignated by a locality pursuant to 818306 of the Code of Virginia.

C. Section 108.3 Applicant information, processing by mail. Application for a permit shall be made by the owner or lessee of
the relevant property or the agent of either or byRB¥®, contractor or subcontractor associated with the work or any of their
agents. The full name and address of the owner, lessee and applicant shall be provided in the application. If the sseeer or le
is a corporate body, when and to the extent detexdnnecessary by the building official, the full name and address of the
responsible officers shall also be provided.

A permit application may be submitted by mail and such permit applications shall be processed by mail, unless the permit
applicant voluntdly chooses otherwise. In no case shall an applicant be required to appear in person.

The building official may accept applications for a permit through electronic submissions provided the information required
by this section is obtained.

D. Section 108l Prerequisites to obtaining permit. In accordance with 852111 of the Code of Virginia, any person
applying to the building department for the construction, removal or improvement of any structure shall furnish prior to the
issuance of the permit eith@) satisfactory proof to the building official that he is duly licensed or certified under the terms or
Chapter 11 (854:1000 et seq.) of Title 54.1 of the Code of Virginia to carry out or superintend the same or (ii) file a written
statement, suppodeby an affidavit, that he is not subject to licensure or certification as a contractor or subcontractor pursuant
to Chapter 11 of Title 54.1 of the Code of Virginia. The applicant shall also furnish satisfactory proof that the tareser li
fees requied by any county, city, or town have been paid so as to be qualified to bid upon or contract for the work for which
the permit has been applied.

E. Section 108.5 Mechanics' lien agent designation. In accordance widB8B60f the Code of Virginia, a iding permit
issued for any oneor two-family residential dwelling shall at the time of issuance contain, at the request of the applicant, the
name, mailing address, and telephone number of the mechanics' lien agent as definet of t84¢3Code of Vginia. If the

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

14



Regulations

designation of a mechanics' lien agent is not so requested by the applicant, the building permit shall at the timesaftatsuanc
that none has been designated with the words "None Designated."

F. Section 108.6 Application form, descripti of work. The application for a permit shall be submitted on a form or forms
supplied by the local building department. The application shall contain a general description and location of the podposed w
and such other information as determined necgdsathe building official.

G. Section 108.7 Amendments to application. An application for a permit may be amended at any time prior to the completi
of the work governed by the permit. Additional construction documents or other records may also ittedsira like
manner. All such submittals shall have the same effect as if filed with the original application for a permit and dfaadicloe re
in a like manner as the original filings.

H. Section 108.8 Time limitation of application. An application & permit for any proposed work shall be deemed to have
been abandoned six months after the date of filing unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a penmit has |
issued, except that the building official is authorized to grant onenare extensions of time if a justifiable cause is
demonstrated.

[ 13VAC5-63-100. Section 110 Permits.

A. Section 110.1 Approval and issuance of permits. The building official shall examine or cause to be examined &
applications for permits or ameménts to such applications within a reasonable time after filing. If the applications or
amendments do not comply with the provisions of this code or all pertinent laws and ordinances, the permit shall ndt be isst
and the permit applicant shall be nadiin writing of the reasons for not issuing the permit. If the application complies with
the applicable requirements of this code, a permit shall be issued as soon as practicable. The issuance of permiie shall n
delayed in an effort to control theqeof construction of new detached eaetwo-family dwellings.

B. Section 110.2 Types of permits. Separate or combined permits may be required for different areas of construction suct
building construction, plumbing, electrical, and mechanical workpr special construction as determined appropriate by the
locality. In addition, permits for two or more buildings or structures on the same lot may be combined. Annual permits me
also be issued fomlterationsto-an-existing-structua@y constructiomegulated by this codérhe annual permit holder shall
maintain a detailed record of all alterations made under the annual permit. Such record shall be available to theflmigding of
and shall be submitted to the local building department if requbsgtéte building official.

C. Section 110.3 Asbestos inspection in buildings to be renovated or demolished; exceptions. In accordanc®itro§36
the Code of Virginia, the local building department shall not issue a building permit allowing a dpdddiwhich an initial
building permit was issued before January 1, 1985, to be renovated or demolished until the local building department recei
certification from the owner or his agent that the affected portions of the building have been inspetttedpofesence of
asbestos by an individual licensed to perform such inspections pursuant te6834o01 the Code of Virginia and that no
asbestogontaining materials were found or that appropriate response actions will be undertaken in accordaree with t
requirements of the Clean Air Act National Emission Standard for the Hazardous Air Pollutant (NESHAPS) (40 CFR Part 6
Subpart M), and the asbestos worker protection requirements established by the U.S. Occupational Safety and He
Administration forconstruction workers (29 CFR 1926.1101). Local educational agencies that are subject to the requiremer
established by the Environmental Protection Agency under the Asbestos Hazard Emergency Response Act (AHERA) shall &
certify compliance with 40 CFRart 763 and subsequent amendments thereto.

To meet the inspection requirements above, except with respect to schools, asbestos inspection of renovation proj
consisting only of repair or replacement of roofing, floorcovering, or siding materials ensatisfied by a statement that the
materials to be repaired or replaced are assumed to contain friable asbestos and that asbestos installation, remova
encapsulation will be accomplished by a licensed asbestos contractor.

The provisions of this sectn shall not apply to singifamily dwellings or residential housing with four or fewer units unless
the renovation or demolition of such buildings is for commercial or public development purposes. The provisions obthis secti
shall not apply if the combed amount of regulated asbestmstaining material involved in the renovation or demolition is
less than 260 linear feet on pipes or less than 160 square feet on other facility components or less than 35 cubiciliset off f
components where the lethgor area could not be measured previously.

An abatement area shall not be reoccupied until the building official receives certification from the owner that the respon
actions have been completed and final clearances have been measured. The faradecleaels for reoccupancy of the
abatement area shall be 0.01 or fewer asbestos fibers per cubic centimeter if determined by Phase Contrast Microssopy anc
(PCM) or 70 or fewer structures per square millimeter if determined by Transmission Elearosddpy analysis (TEM).

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

15



Regulations

D. Section 110.4 Fire apparatus access road requirements. The permit applicant shall be informed of any requirements for
providing or maintaining fire apparatus access roads prior to the issuance of a building permit.

E. Section110.5 Signature on and posting of permits; limitation of approval. The signature of the building official or
authorized representative shall be on or affixed to every permit. A copy of the permit shall be posted on the congtrémtion si
public inspedbn until the work is completed. Such posting shall include the street or lot number, if one has been assigned, to
be readable from a public way. In addition, each building or structure to which a street number has been assigned shall, upon
completion, hag the number displayed so as to be readable from the public way.

A permit shall be considered authority to proceed with construction in accordance with this code, the approved construction
documents, the permit application and any approved amendmentsdifications. The permit shall not be construed to
otherwise authorize the omission or amendment of any provision of this code.

F. Section 110.6uspension—of-a—permiibandonment of workAny—permit A building official shall become-invalidbe
permitted ¢ revoke a permif work on the site authorized by the permit is not commenced within six months after issuance of
the permit, or if the authorized work on the site is suspended or abandoned for a period of six months tafterghe

commencing-the—worlpermit is issuedhowever, permits issued fdauilding—egquipmentsuch-gdumbing, electrical and
mechanical work shall nddeceme-invalidbe revokedf the building permit is still in effect. It shall be the responsibility of the

permit applicant to prav to the building official thatuthorizedwork has—net-beenr—suspended—oer—abandoinetiides
substantive progress, characterized by approved inspections as specified in Section 113.3 of at least one inspection within a
period of six months or other evidenthat would indicate substantial work has been perfortdedn written request, the

building official may grant one or more extensions of time, not to exceed one year per extension.

G. Section 110.Binglefamily dwelling permits. The building officialhgll be permitted to require a three year time limit to
complete construction of new detached siffgimily dwellings, additions to detached sindgenily dwellings and residential
accessory structures. The time limit shall begin from the issuance dhtemdrmit. The building official may grant extensions
of time if the applicant can demonstrate substantive progress, characterized by approved inspections as specified in Section
113.3 of at least one inspection within a period of six months or othegremadhat would indicate substantial work has been

performed.

H. Section 110.&Revocation of a permit. The building official may revoke a permit or approval issued under this code in the
case of any false statement, misrepresentation qf daeindonmentfowork, failure to complete construction as required by
Section 110.7r incorrect information supplied by the applicant in the application or construction documents on which the
permit or approval was basdd.

[ 13VAC5-63-110. Section 111 RDP services.

A. Section 111.1 When required. In accordance with 8840 of the Code of Virginia and under the general authority of this

code, the local building department shall establish a procedure to ensure that construction documents under Section 109 are
prepard by an RDP in any case in which the exemptions containe@54.8401, 54.1402 or854.1-402.1 of the Code of
Virginia are not applicable or in any case where the building official determines it necessary. When required und@2854.1

of the Code of Viginia or when required by the building official, or both, construction documents shall bear the name and
address of the author and his occupation.

Note: Information on the types of construction required to be designed by an RDP is included in the lRelatedckage"
available from DHCD.

B. Section 111.2 Special inspection requirements. Special inspections shall be coaddetethe-supervision-ofregistered
des&gn—pmiessmal&and—m—aeeerd&neewﬁen required b)‘Bectlon 1704Peﬁsen&engaged4he—tesung—and—mspeenen of

agencies, or both conductlnq speual mspectlons shall meet the qualification requwements of Sectiond 1708.hiThe

permit applicant shall submit @mpletedstatement of special inspectiondth the permit application. The building official
shall review, and if satisfied that the requirements have been met, approve the statement of special inspecfitres] 48
Sections 1704.1.1 and 17@S a requisite to the issuance of a building periitie_building official may require interim
inspection reports. The building official shall receive, and if satisfied that the requirements have been met, ajpmabve a f
report of special inspections as specified in Section 1704All.&2es and costs related to the special inspections shall be the
responsibility of the building owne}.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

16



Regulations

13VAC5-63-120. Section 112 Workmanship, materials and equipment.

A. Section 1121 General. It shall be the duty of any person performing work covered by this code to comply with all
applicable provisions of this code and to perform and complete such work so as to secure the results intended by the USBC.

B. Section 112.2 Alternative ethods or materials. In accordance with 8860f the Code of Virginia, where practical, the
provisions of this code are stated in terms of required level of performance so as to facilitate the prompt acceptance of
building materials and methods. Whganerally recognized standards of performance are not available, this section and othe
applicable requirements of this code provide for acceptance of materials and methods whose performance is substantially e
in safety to those specified on the basisreliable test and evaluation data presented by the proponent. In addition, as a
requirement of this code, the building official shall require that sufficient technical data be submitted to substantiate tt
proposed use of any material, equipment, dexdssembly or method of construction.

C. Section 112.3 Documentation and approval. In determining whether any material, equipment, device, assembly or metl
of construction complies with this code, the building official shall approve items listed byalbtisecognized testing
laboratories (NRTL), when such items are listed for the intended use and application, and in addition, may consider t
recommendations of RDPs. Approval shall be issued when the building official finds that the proposed desisfadtory
and complies with the intent of the provisions of this code and that the material, equipment, device, assembly or method
construction offered is, for the purpose intended, at least the equivalent of that prescribed by theqoadigr—drength,
effectivenessfireresistance—durabilityand-safStych approval is subject to all applicable requirements of this code and the
material, equipment, device, assembly or method of construction shall be installed in accordance with thescohttion
approval and their listings. In addition, the building official may revoke such approval whenever it is discovered that suc
approval was issued in error or on the basis of incorrect information, or where there are repeated violations of the USBC.

D. Section 112.3.1 Conditions of listings. Where conflicts between this code and conditions of the listing or the matsufacture
installation instructions occur, the provisions of this code shall apply.

Exception: Where a code provision is less restrictivan the conditions of the listing of the equipment or appliance or the
manufacturer's installation instructions, the conditions of the listing and the manufacturer's installation instrudtimmglghal

E. Section 112.4 Used material and equipmenedUsaterials, equipment and devices may be approved provided they have
been reconditioned, tested or examined and found to be in good and proper working condition and acceptable for use by
building official.

13VAC5-63-130. Section 113 Inspections.

A. Section 113.1 General. In accordance with-886 of the Code of Virginia, any building or structure may be inspected at
any time before completion, and shall not be deemed in compliance until approved by the inspecting authority. Where t
construction cst is less than $2,500, however, the inspection may, in the discretion of the inspecting authority, be waived. Tl
building official shall coordinate all reports of inspections for compliance with the USBC, with inspections of fire ahd heal
officials dekegated such authority, prior to the issuance of an occupancy permit.

B. Section 113.1.1 Equipment required. Any ladder, scaffolding or test equipment necessary to conduct or witness a reque:
inspection shall be provided by the permit holder.

C. Sectim 113.1.2 Duty to notify. When construction reaches a stage of completion that requires an inspection, the perr
holder shall notify the building official.

D. Section 113.1.3 Duty to inspect. Except as provided for in Section 113.7, the building sffaigderform the requested
inspection in accordance with Section 113.6 when notified in accordance with Section 113.1.2.

E. Section 113.2 Prerequisites. The building official may conduct a site inspection prior to issuing a permit. When gonductil
inspections pursuant to this code, all personnel shall carry proper credentials.

F. Section 113.3 Minimum inspections. The following minimum inspections shall be conducted by the building official wher
applicable to the construction or permit:

1. Inspection bfooting excavations and reinforcement material for concrete footings prior to the placement of concrete.
2. Inspection of foundation systems during phases of construction necessary to assure compliance with this code.

3. Inspection of preparatory wogkior to the placement of concrete.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

17



Regulations

4. Inspection of structural members and fasteners prior to concealment.

5. Inspection of electrical, mechanical and plumbing materials, equipment and systems prior to concealment.
6. Inspection of energy conservatioraterial prior to concealment.

7. Final inspection.

G. Section 113.4 Additional inspections. The building official may designate additional inspections and tests to be conducted
during the construction of a building or structure and shall so notifyahaipholder.

H. Section 113.5 hplant and factory inspections. When required by the provisions of this code, materials, equipment or
assemblies shall be inspected at the point of manufacture or fabrication. The building official shall require thel sfitamit
evaluation report of such materials, equipment or assemblies. The evaluation report shall indicate the complete details of th
assembly including a description of the assembly and its components, and describe the basis upon which the assegbly is
evaluated. In addition, test results and other data as necessary for the building official to determine conformance with the
USBC shall be submitted. For factory inspections, an identifying label or stamp permanently affixed to materials, equipment o
assemblies indicating that a factory inspection has been made shall be acceptable instead of a written inspection report,
provided the intent or meaning of such identifying label or stamp is properly substantiated.

I. Section 113.6 Approval or notice d&fective work. The building official shall either approve the work in writing or give
written notice of defective work to the permit holder. Upon request of the permit holder, the notice shall reference the USBC
section that serves as the basis for hiects and such defects shall be corrected and reinspected before any work proceeds that
would conceal such defects. A record of all reports of inspections, tests, examinations, discrepancies and approva issued s
be maintained by the building offidiand shall be communicated promptly in writing to the permit holder. Approval issued
under this section may be revoked whenever it is discovered that such approval was issued in error or on the bastd of incorre
information, or where there are repeatéations of the USBC.

J. Section 113.7 Approved inspection agencies. The building official may accept reports of inspections and tests from
approvedndividuals orapprevednspection agenciesvhich-satisfyapproved in accordance with the building déits written
policy required by Section 113.7.1. The individual or inspection agency shall meeju#ifications and reliability
requirementsestablished by the written policyJnder circumstances where the building official is unable to make the
inspedion or testrequired by Section 113.3 or 113wthin two working days of a request or an agreed upon dafé
authorized for other circumstances in the building official's written potey building official shall accept reports for review
The buildng official shall approve the repoftom such approved individuals or agenciggess there is cause to reject it.
Failure to approve a report shall be in writing within two working days of receiving it stating the reason for the r&aetion
reportsReports of inspections conducted by approved tpady inspectors or agencishall be in writing shall indicate if
compliance with the applicable provisions of the USBC have beemmdeshall be certified by the individual inspector or by
the responsile officer when the report is from an agency.

Note: Photographs, videotapes or other sources of pertinent data or information may be considered as constitutingssuch report
and tests.

K. Section 113.7.1 Thirgharty inspectors. Each building official agad with the enforcement of the USBC shall have a
written policy establishing the minimum acceptable qualifications for4tartly inspectors. The policy shall include the format
and time frame required for submission of reports, any prequalificatipreapproval requirementefore conducting a third
party inspectiorand any other requirements and procedures established by the building official.

L. Section 113.7.2 Qualifications. In determining thirakty inspector qualifications, the building offitimay consider such
items as DHCD inspector certification, other state or national certifications, state professional registrations, ret&adesxpe
education and any other factors that would demonstrate competency and reliability to conduct figspectio

M. Section 113.8 Final inspection. Upon completion of a building or structure and before the issuance of a certificate of
occupancy, a final inspection shall be conducted to ensure that any defective work has been corrected and that all work
complies vith the USBC and has been approved, including any work associated with modifications under Section 106.3. The
approval of a final inspection shall be permitted to serve as the new certificate of occupancy required by Sectiorh£16.1 in t
case of additioner alterations to existing buildings or structures that already have a certificate of occupancy.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

18



Regulations

13VAC5-63-150. Section 115 Violations.

A. Section 115.1 Violation a misdemeanor; civil penalty. In accordance witHl@3&®f the Code of Virginia, it shalle
unlawful for any owner or any other person, firm or corporation, on or after the effective date of any code provisiolase to vi
any such provisions. Any locality may adopt an ordinance that establishes a uniform schedule of civil penaltiesdns wiblat
specified provisions of the code that are not abated or remedied promptly after receipt of a notice of violation fraah the loc
enforcement officer.

Note: See the full text of 83606 of the Code of Virginia for additional requirements and critgeidaining to legal action
relative to violations of the code.

B. Section 115.2 Notice of violation. The building official shall issue a written notice of violation to the responsipbié part
any violations of this code or any directives or orders ofutéding official have not been corrected or complied with in a
reasonable time. The notice shall reference the code section upon which the notice is based and direct the discontinuance
abatement of the violation or the compliance with such direoti@der. The notice shall be issued by either delivering a copy
to the responsible party by mail to the last known address or delivering the notice in person or by leaving it in thenpafssess
any person in charge of the premises, or by posting theeniot a conspicuous place if the person in charge of the premises
cannot be found. The notice of violation shall indicate the right of appeal by referencing the appeals section. Whendhe owne
the building or structure, or the permit holder for thestarction in question, or the tenants of such building or structure, are
not the responsible party to whom the notice of violation is issued, then a copy of the notice shall also be delivesedhto the
owner, permit holder or tenants.

C. Section 115.2.Notice not to be issued under certain circumstances. When violations are discovered more than two yee
after the certificate of occupancy is issued or the date of initial occupancy, whichever occurred later, or more thas two ye:
after the approved finahspection for an alteration or renovation, a notice of violation shall only be issued upon advice from
the legal counsel of the locality that action may be taken to compel correction of the violation. When compliance camn no long
be compelled by prosettan under 836L06 of the Code of Virginia, the building officialvhen requested by the building
owner,shall documenin writing the existence of the violatiamdnotingthe edition of the USBC the violation is under.

D. Section 115.3 Further action wheiolation not corrected. If the responsible party has not complied with the notice of
violation, the building official shall submit a written request to the legal counsel of the locality to institute theiapplegal
proceedings to restrain, corremt abate the violation or to require the removal or termination of the use of the building or
structure involved. In cases where the locality so authorizes, the building official may issue or obtain a summons or warra
Compliance with a notice of violah notwithstanding, the building official may request legal proceedings be instituted for
prosecution when a person, firm or corporation is served with three or more notices of violation within one calendar year f
failure to obtain a required construmtipermit prior to commencement of work subject to this code.

Note: See §19:8 of the Code of Virginia concerning the statute of limitations for building code prosecutions.

E. Section 115.4 Penalties and abatement. Penalties for violations of the U3IB§& stzaset out in 83606 of the Code of
Virginia. The successful prosecution of a violation of the USBC shall not preclude the institution of appropriate leged actio
require correction or abatement of a violation.

[ 13VAC5-63-160. Section 116 Cerficates of occupancy.

A. Section 116.1 General; when to be issued. A certificate of occupancy indicating completion of the work for which a perm
was issued shall be obtained prior to the occupancy of any building or structure, except as providad feedtion generally
and as specifically provided for in Section 113.8 for additions or alterations. The certificate shall be issued aftéoranplet
the final inspection and when the building or structure is in compliance with this code and amgnpéatis or ordinances, or
when otherwise entitled. The building official shall, however, issue a certificate of occupancy within five working days afte
being requested to do so, provided the building or structure meets all of the requirements iftcadecert

Exception: A certificate of occupancy is not required for an accessory structure as defined in the International Resident
Code.

B. Section 116.1.1 Temporary certificate of occupancy. Upon the request of a permit holder, a temporaryeceftificat
occupancy may be issued before the completion of the work covered by a permit, provided that such portion or portions o
building of structure may be occupied safely prior to full completion of the building or structure without endangering life o
public safety.

C. Section 116.2 Contents of certificate. A certificate of occupancy shall specify the following:

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

19



Regulations

1. The edition of the USBC under which the permit is issued.

2. The group classification and occupancy in accordance with the provisiohauieC3.

3. The type of construction as defined in Chapter 6.

4. If an automatic sprinkler system is provided and whether or not such system was required.

5. Any special stipulations and conditions of the building permit and if any modificationsssaesliunder the permit, there
shall be a notation on the certificate that modifications were issued.

D. Section 116.3 Suspension or revocation of certificate. A certificate of occupancy may be revoked or suspended whenever
the building official discovershat such certificate was issued in error or on the basis of incorrect information, or where there
are repeated violations of the USB@er the certificate has been issued or when requested by the code official under Section
105.7 of the Virginia Maintem&e Code The revocation or suspension shall be in writargd shall state the necessary
corrections or conditions for the certificate to be reissued or reinstated in accordance with Section 116.3.1

E. Sectionl16.3.1 Reissuance of reinstatement of gedti€ of occupancy. When a certificate of occupancy has been revoked
or suspended, it shall be reissued or reinstated upon correction of the specific condition or conditions cited as fhtheause o
revocation or suspension and the revocation or suspens$ia certificate of occupancy shall not be used as justification for
requiring a building or structure to be subject to a later edition of the code than that under which such buildingrerwésictu
initially constructed.

F. Section116.4 Issuance ofectificate for existing buildings or structures. Upon written request from the owner or the
owner's agent, or as otherwise determined necessary by the building official, a certificate of occupancy shall be éssued for
existing building or structure pradeéd there are no current violations of the Virginia Maintenance Code or the Virginia
Statewide Fire Prevention Code (13VAGS) and the occupancy classification of the building or structure has not changed. An
inspection shall be performed prior to theuessce of the certificate and such buildings and structures shall not be prevented
from continued usdq.

13VAC5-63-190. Section 119 Appeals.

A. Section 119.1 Establishment of appeals board. In accordance with0836f the Code of Virginia, there shall be
established within each local building department a LBBCA. Whenever a county or a municipality does not have such a
LBBCA, the local governing body shall enter into an agreement with the local governing body of another county or
municipality or with somether agency, or a state agency approved by DHCD for such appeals resulting therefrom. Fees may
be levied by the local governing body in order to defray the cost of such appeals. In addition, as an authorizati@u@ this c
separate LBBCAs may be estabiéd to hear appeals of different enforcement areas such as electrical, plumbing or mechanical
requirements. Each such LBBCA shall comply with the requirements of this section.

B. Section 119.2 Membership of board. The LBBCA shall consist of at leasinfiwebers appointed by the locality for a
specific term of office established by written policy. Alternate members may be appointed to serve in the absence of any
regular members and as such, shall have the full power and authority of the regular mengjotais.aRd alternate members
may be reappointed. Written records of current membership, including a record of the current chairman and secretary shall be
maintained in the office of the locality. In order to provide continuity, the terms of the membelzeadifferent length so
that less than half will expire in any egear period.

C. Section 119.3 Officers and qualifications of members. The LBBCA shall annually select one of its regular members to
serve as chairman. When the chairman is not presantappeal hearing, the members present shall select an acting chairman.
The locality or the chief executive officer of the locality shall appoint a secretary to the LBBCA to maintain a detaibtbdfrec
all proceedings. Members of the LBBCA shall be del@dy the locality on the basis of their ability to render fair and
competent decisions regarding application of the USBC and shall to the extent possible, represent different occupational or
professional fields relating to the construction industry. esist one member should be an experienced builder; at least one
member should be an RDP, and at least one member should be an experienced property manager. Employees or officials of the
locality shall not serve as members of the LBBCA.

D. Section 119.4 Conatt of members. No member shall hear an appeal in which that member has a conflict of interest in
accordance with the State and Local Government Conflict of Interests Act3&202et seq. of the Code of Virginia).
Members shall not discuss the substaofcan appeal with any other party or their representatives prior to any hearings.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

20



Regulations

E. Section 119.5 Right of appeal; filing of appeal application. The owner of a building or structure, the owner's agent or a
other person involved in the design or condtarcof a building or structure may appeal a decision of the building official
concerning the application of the USBC to such building or structure and may also appeal a refusal by the building official
grant a modification to the provisions of the USB€rtaining to such building or structure. The applicant shall submit a written
request for appeal to the LBBCA with@® 30 calendar days of the receipt of the decision being appealed. The application shall
contain the name and address of the owner obthigling or structure and in addition, the name and address of the person
appealing, when the applicant is not the owner. A copy of the building official's decision shall be submitted along with th
application for appeal and maintained as part of therded he application shall be marked by the LBBCA to indicate the date
received. Failure to submit an application for appeal within the time limit established by this section shall consttsrcacce
of a building official's decision.

Note: To the extanthat a decision of a building official pertains to amusement devices there may be a right of appeal unde
the VADR.

F. Section 119.6 Meetings and postponements. The LBBCA shall meet within 30 calendar days after the date of receipt of
application forappeal, except that a longer time period shall be permitted if agreed to by all the parties involved in the appe:
A notice indicating the time and place of the hearing shall be sent to the parties in writing to the addresses listed on
application ateast 14 calendar days prior to the date of the hearing, except that a lesser time period shall be permitted if agre
to by all the parties involved in the appeal. When a quorum of the LBBCA is not present at a hearing to hear an appeal,
party invohed in the appeal shall have the right to request a postponement of the hearing. The LBBCA shall reschedule 1
appeal within 30 calendar days of the postponement, except that a longer time period shall be permitted if agreetig¢o by all
parties involvedn the appeal.

G. Section 119.7 Hearings and decision. All hearings before the LBBCA shall be open meetings and the appellant, 1
appellant's representative, the locality's representative and any person whose interests are affected by the building offic
decision in question shall be given an opportunity to be heard. The chairman shall have the power and duty to direct
hearing, rule upon the acceptance of evidence and oversee the record of all proceedings. The LBBCA shall have the powe
uphold, reverse or modify the decision of the official by a concurring vote of a majority of those present. Decisions of the
LBBCA shall be final if no further appeal is made. The decision of the LBBCA shall be by resolution signed by the chairma
and retained ggsart of the record of the appeal. Copies of the resolution shall be sent to all parties by certified mail. In additior
the resolution shall contain the following wording:

"Any person who was a party to the appeal may appeal to the State Review Boaliiiyirgpian application to such
Board within 21 calendar days upon receipt by certified mail of this resolution. Application forms are available from the
Office of the State Review Board, 501 North Second Street, Richmond, Virginia 23219, (804)5817'1

H. Section 119.8 Appeals to the State Review Board. After final determination by the LBBCA in an appeal, any person wt
was a party to the appeal may further appeal to the State Review Board. In accordance-@#t2 ®8&he Code of Virginia
for stateowned buildings and structures, appeals by an involved state agency from the decision of the building official for stat
owned buildings or structures shall be made directly to the State Review Board. The application for appeal shall beanade to
State Reiew Board within 21 calendar days of the receipt of the decision to be appealed. Failure to submit an applicatic
within that time limit shall constitute an acceptance of the building official's decision. For appeals from a LBBCA, & copy o
the building oficial's decision and the resolution of the LBBCA shall be submitted with the application for appeal to the State
Review Board. Upon request by the office of the State Review Board, the LBBCA shall submit a copy of all pertiner
information from the recorof the appeal. In the case of appeals involving stateed buildings or structures, the involved
state agency shall submit a copy of the building official's decision and other relevant information with the applicapipedior
to the State Review BoarBrocedures of the State Review Board are in accordance with Article-2@834 seq.) of Chapter
6 of Title 36 of the Code of Virginia. Decisions of the State Review Board shall be final if no further appeal is made.

[ 13VAC5-63-200. Chapter 2 Definitons: Section 202 Definitions.
A. Add the following definitions to Section 202 of the IBC to read:

Building regulations. Any law, rule, resolution, regulation, ordinance or code, general or special, or compilation thereo
heretofore or hereafter enacted adopted by the Commonwealth or any county or municipality, including departments,
boards, bureaus, commissions, or other agencies thereof, relating to construction, reconstruction, alteration, convers
repair, maintenance, or use of structures amittlings and installation of equipment therein. The term does not include
zoning ordinances or other land use controls that do not affect the manner of construction or materials to be used in
erection, alteration or repair of a building or structure.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

21



Regulations

Construction. The construction, reconstruction, alteration, repair, or conversion of buildings and structures.
Day-night average sound level (Ldn). See Section 1202.1.
DHCD. The Virginia Department of Housing and Community Development.

Emergency commuapation equipment. See Section 902.1.

Emergency public safety personnel. See Section 902.1.

Equipment. Plumbing, heating, electrical, ventilating;cainditioning and refrigeration equipment, elevators, dumbwaiters,
escalators, and other mechanical addgior installations.

Farm building or structure. A building or structure not used for residential purposes, located on property where farming
operations take place, and used primarily for any of the following uses or combination thereof:

1. Storage, hatithg, production, display, sampling or sale of agricultural, horticultural, floricultural or silvicultural
products produced in the farm.

2. Sheltering, raising, handling, processing or sale of agricultural animals or agricultural animal products.

3. Busness or office uses relating to the farm operations.

4. Use of farm machinery or equipment or maintenance or storage of vehicles, machinery or equipment on the farm.
5. Storage or use of supplies and materials used on the farm.

6. Implementation of bésnanagement practices associated with farm operations.

Industrialized building. A combination of one or more sections or modules, subject to state regulations and including the
necessary electrical, plumbing, heating, ventilating and other service systemufactured offite and transported to the

point of use for installation or erection, with or without other specified components, to comprise a finished building.
Manufactured homes shall not be considered industrialized buildings for the purplisecofie.

Local board of building code appeals (LBBCA). See Section 119.1.

Local building department. The agency or agencies of any local governing body charged with the administration,
supervision, or enforcement of this code, approval of constructianndents, inspection of buildings or structures, or
issuance of permits, licenses, certificates or similar documents.

Local governing body. The governing body of any city, county or town in this Commonwealth.
Locality. A city, county or town in this Comomwealth.

Manufactured home. A structure subject to federal regulation, which is transportable in one or more sections; is eight body
feet or more in width and 40 body feet or more in length in the traveling mode, or is 320 or more square feet wbemerecte
site; is built on a permanent chassis; is designed to be used as afaimyledwelling, with or without a permanent
foundation, when connected to the required utilities; and includes the plumbing, heatowndiiioning, and electrical
systems ontained in the structure.

Night club. Any building in which the main use is a place of public assembly that provides exhibition, performance or other
forms of entertainment; serves alcoholic beverages; and provides music and space for dancing.

Skirting. A weathefresistant material used to enclose the space from the bottom of the manufactured home to grade.
Sound transmission class (STC) rating. See Section 1202.1.

State regulated care facility (SRCF). A building with an occupancy in Gre2pRR3, R-4 or R5 occupied by persons in

the care of others where program oversight is provided by the Virginia Department of Social Services, the Virginia
Department of Mental Health, Mental Retardation and Substance Abuse Services, the Virginia DepartmemttiohEatuc

the Virginia Department of Juvenile Justice.

State Review Board. The Virginia State Building Code Technical Review Board as established uids &Bhe Code of
Virginia.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

22



Regulations

Technical assistant. Any person employed by or under an extendedctaonta local building department or local enforcing
agency for enforcing the USBC, including but not limited to inspectors and plans reviewers. For the purpose of th
definition, an extended contract shall be a contract with an aggregate term of h8 ordohger.

VADR. The Virginia Amusement Device Regulations (13VAZE).

VCS. The Virginia Certification Standards (13VAQ3).

Working day. A day other than Saturday, Sunday or a legal local, state or national holiday.
B. Change the following defitibns in Section 202 of the IBC to read:

Building. A combination of materials, whether portable or fixed, having a roof to form a structure for the use or occupanc
by persons, or property. The word "building" shall be construed as though followed Wwyri&"or part or parts thereof"
unless the context clearly requires a different meaning. "Building" shall not include roadway tunnels and bridges owned |
the Virginia Department of Transportation, which shall be governed by construction and desigrdstapgeoved by the
Virginia Commonwealth Transportation Board.

For application of this code, each portion of a building that is completely separated from other portions by fire wall
complying with Section 705 shall be considered as a separate bugdm¢BC Section 503.1).

Canopy. A structure or architectural projection of rigid construction over which a covering is attached that provides weath
protection, identity or decoration and may be structurally independent or supported by attachmeiitiogaoimuone end
by not less than one stanchion on the outer end.

Owner. The owner or owners of the freehold of the premises or lesser estate therein, a mortgagee or vendee in posses
assignee of rents, receiver, executor, trustee or lessee in adrarblilding or structure.

Registered Design Professional (RDP). An architect or professional engineer, licensed to practice architecture
engineering, as defined under 85400 of the Code of Virginia.

Structure. An assembly of materials formingamstruction for occupancy or use including stadiums, gospel and circus tents,
reviewing stands, platforms, stagings, observation towers, radio towers, water tanks, storage tanks (underground
aboveground), trestles, piers, wharves, swimming pools, emergt devices, storage bins, and other structures of this
general nature but excluding water wells. The word "structure" shall be construed as though followed by the words "or p:
or parts thereof" unless the context clearly requires a different med8ingcture" shall not include roadway tunnels and
bridges owned by the Virginia Department of Transportation, which shall be governed by construction and design standa
approved by the Virginia Commonwealth Transportation Board.

C. Delete the followinglefinitions from Section 202 of the IBC:
Agricultural building.
Existing building ]
13VAC5-63-210. Chapter 3 Use and occupancy classification.

B- A. Change exception 15 of Secti8@8+9307.10f the IBC to read:

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

23



Regulations

15. The stomge of black powder, smokeless propellant and small arms primers in Groups8 MndR R5 and special
industrial explosive devices in Groups B, F, M and S, provided such storage conforms to the quantity limits and
requirements prescribed in the InternasibRire Code, as amended in Sec8§¥-9-1307.9

C- B. Add Sectior367-9-1307.9to the IBC to read:

367-9-1307.9Amendments. The following changes shall be made to the International Fire Code for the use of Exception
15 in Sectior86#9307.1

1. Chang Section 314.1 of the IFC to read as follows:

314.1 General. Indoor displays constructed within any building or structure shall comply with Sections 314.2 through
314.5.

2. Add new Section 314.5 to the IFC to read as follows:

314.5 Smokeless powder andaharms primers. Vendors shall not store, display or sell smokeless powder or small arms
primers during trade shows inside exhibition halls except as follows:

1. The amount of smokeless powder each vender may store is limited to the storage arrangeinstotage amounts
established in Section 3306.5.2.1.

2. Smokeless powder shall remain in the manufacturer's original sealed container and the container shall remain sealed
while inside the building. The repackaging of smokeless powder shall not be peifamside the building. Damaged
containers shall not be repackaged inside the building and shall be immediately removed from the building in such manner
to avoid spilling any powder.

3. There shall be at least 50 feet separation between vendors andf&iniesty exit.

4. Small arms primers shall be displayed and stored in the manufacturer's original packaging and in accordance with the
requirements of Section 3306.5.2.3.

3. Change Exception 4 and add Exceptions 10 and 11 to Section 3301.1 of thedk@nas f

4. The possession, storage and use of not more than 15 pounds (6.75 kg) of commercially manufactured sporting black
powder, 20 pounds (9 kg) of smokeless powder and any amount of small arms primers for hand loading of small arms
ammunition for persnal consumption.

10. The display of small arms primers in Group M when in the original manufacturer's packaging.

11. The possession, storage and use of not more than 50 pounds (23 kg) of commercially manufactured sporting black
powder, 100 pounds (45 kgf smokeless powder, and small arms primers for hand loading of small arms ammunition for
personal consumption in Group3Ror R5, or 200 pounds (91 kg) of smokeless powder when stored in the manufacturer's
original containers in detached Group U struesuait least 10 feet (3048 mm) from inhabited buildings and are accessory to
Group R3 or R5.

4. Change the definition of Smokeless Propellants in Section 3302.1 of the IFC as follows:

SMOKELESS PROPELLANTS. Solid propellants, commonly referred to as desskepowders, or any propellants
classified by DOTn as smokeless propellants in accordance with NA3178 (Smokeless Powder for Small Arms), used in
small arms ammunition, firearms, cannons, rockets, propetstnated devices and similar articles.

5. Changesection 3306.4 of the IFC to read as follows:

3306.4 Storage in residences. Propellants for personal use in quantities not exceeding 50 pounds (23 kg) of black powder
or 100 pounds (45 kg) of smokeless powder shall be stored in original containersgaraies limited to Group R and

R-5 or 200 pounds (91 kg) of smokeless powder when stored in the manufacturer's original containers in detached Group U
structures at least 10 feet (3048 mm) from inhabited buildings and are accessory to GrouRRB. In other than Group

R-3 or R5, smokeless powder in quantities exceeding 20 pounds (9 kg) but not exceeding 50 pounds (23 kg) shall be kept
in a wooden box or cabinet having walls of at least one inch (25 mm) nominal thickness or equivalent.

6. Delete Seatins 3306.4.1 and 3306.4.2 of the IFC.
7. Change Section 3306.5.1.1 of the IFC to read as follows:

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

24



Regulations

3306.5.1.1 Smokeless propellant. No more than 100 pounds (45 kg) of smokeless propellants in containers of eight pou
(3.6 kg) or less capacity shall beglesyed in Group M occupancies.

8. Delete Section 3306.5.1.3 of the IFC.
9. Change Section 3306.5.2.1 of the IFC as follows:
3306.5.2.1 Smokeless propellant. Commercial stocks of smokeless propellants shall be stored as follows:

1. Quantities exceeding 2@ynds (9 kg), but not exceeding 100 pounds (45 kg) shall be stored in portable wooden boxe
having walls of at least one inch (25 mm) nominal thickness or equivalent.

2. Quantities exceeding 100 pounds (45 kg), but not exceeding 800 pounds (363 kdpe sibaled in storage cabinets
having walls at least one inch (25 mm) nominal thickness or equivalent. Not more than 400 pounds (182 kg) shall be sto
in any one cabinet, and cabinets shall be separated by a distance of at least 25 feet (7620 mfing galoijtian having a
fire-resistance rating of at least one hour.

3. Storage of quantities exceeding 800 pounds (363 kg), but not exceeding 5,000 pounds (2270 kg) in a building sk
comply with all of the following:

3.1. The storage is inaccessibleutauthorized personnel.

3.2. Smokeless propellant shall be stored in nonportable storage cabinets having wood walls at least one inch (25 n
nominal thickness or equivalent and having shelves with no more than 3 feet (914 mm) of vertical separation betwe
shelves.

3.3. No more than 400 pounds (182 kg) is stored in any one cabinet.

3.4. Cabinets shall be located against walls with at least 40 feet (12 192 mm) between cabinets. The minimum requi
separation between cabinets may be reduced to 20 feetf8@®Brovided that barricades twice the height of the cabinets
are attached to the wall, midway between each cabinet. The barricades must extend a minimum of 10 feet (3048
outward, be firmly attached to the wall, and be constructed of steel notdes8.#5b inch thick (6.4 mm)-iach (51 mm)
nominal thickness wood, brick, or concrete block.

3.5. Smokeless propellant shall be separated from materials classified as combustible liquids, flammable liquic
flammable solids, or oxidizing materials by a&tdince of 25 feet (7620 mm) or by a fire partition having arésistance
rating of 1 hour.

3.6. The building shall be equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Sectic
903.3.1.1.

4. Smokeless propellants not rgtd according to Item 1, 2, or 3 above shall be stored in a Type 2 or 4 magazine in
accordance with Section 3304 and NFPA 495.

not more

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

25



Regulations

ance Abuse
more resident

E-D.] Change Section 308.5.2 of the IBC to read:

308.5.2 Child care facility. A facilityother than family day homes under Section 310.4 that provides supervision and
personal care on less than atfslr basis for more than five childrerl22 years of age or less shall be classified as Group |
4.

Exception: A child day care facility that prides care for more than five but no more than 100 childt&f2 3ears or less of
age, when the rooms where such children are cared for are located on the level of exit discharge and each of these child care
rooms has an exit door directly to the extergirall be classified as Group E.

[ & E.] Add-aChange occupandyelassificationclassificationy "R-1" [ and "R4" ] and addnew occupancy classification
"R-5" to Section 310 of the IBC to read:

R-1 Residential occupancies containing sleeping unitsre/the occupants are primarily transient in nature, including:

Boarding houses (transient)

Hotels (transient)
Motels (transient)

[ Bed and breakfasts and other transient boarding facilities with 10 or fewer occupants are permitted to be classified as
Grow R-3 or R5.

Exceptions:

1. Nonproprietor occupied bed and breakfast and other transient boarding facilities not more than three stories above grade
plane in height with a maximum of 10 occupants total are permitted to be classified as either GrouGRup R5

provided that smoke alarms are installed in compliance with Section 907.2.10.1.2 for GBoop $ection 313.1 of the
International Residential Code for GrougbR

2. Proprietor occupied bed and breakfast and other transient boarding facditieore than three stories above grade

plane in height, that are also occupied as the residence of the proprietor, with a maximum of five guest room sleeping units
provided for the transient occupants are permitted to be classified as either G3ouRFS provided that smoke alarms

are installed in compliance with Section 907.2.10.1.2 for Gro@poR Section 313.1 of the International Residential Code

for Group R5.

R-4 Residential occupancies shall include buildings arranged for occupancy as i@shsfassisted living facilities
including more than five but not more than 16 occupants, excluding staff.

Group R4 occupancies shall meet the requirements for construction as defined for GBo@xde pt as otherwise provided
for in this code, or shilacomply with the International Residential Code with the additional requirement to provide an
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.2.7.

Exception: Group homes licensed by the Virginia Department of Mental Health, Mental RetarddtiSnlestance Abuse
Services or the Virginia Department of Social Services that house no more than eight persons with one or more resident

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

26



Regulations

counselors shall be classified as Grow2,RR-3, R4 or R5. Not more than five of the persons may require physical
assistance from staff to respond to an emergency situation.

DefaehedResrdentlal occupanmes |n detacrmme and twoefamily dwellings and—multiple—singldamily-dwellings
o , aonadsousesand their accessory structures

wrthrn the scope of the Internatronal Re5|dent|al Code also referred to as the "IRC."
[ & E.] Add Section 310.3 to the IBC to read:

310.3 Group B5. The construction of Group-R structures shall comply with tHeterhational-Residential- Code—also
referred-to-as-thelRC* The amendments to the IRC set out in Section 310.6 shall be made to the IRC for its use as part
this code In addrtron aII references to Section 101.2 in the IBC relating to the constufmmand—wefamly—dweumgs

eigttt structures subject to the IRC

shaII be conS|dered to be references to thrs section.

[ H- G.] Add Section 310.3.1 to the IBC tead:

310.3.1 Additional requirements. Methods of construction, materials, systems, equipment or components for35roup R
structures not addressed by prescriptive or performance provisions of the IRC shall comply with applicable B¢
requirements.

[ + H.] Add Section 310.4 to the IBC to read:

310.4 Family day homes. Family day homes where program oversight is provided by the Virginia Department of Soci
Services shall be classified as Grow2,RR-3 or R5.

Note: Family day homes may generally care fortad2 children. See the DHCD Related Laws Package for additional
information.

[ +1.] Add Section 310.5 to the IBC to read:

310.5 Radosresistant construction in Group-Rand R4 structures. Group R and R4 structures shall be subject to the
radonresistant construction requirements in Appendix F in localities enforcing such requirements pursuant tdRSadtion
R3250f the IRC.

[ & J.] Add Section 310.6 to the IBC to read:
310.6 Amendments to the IRC. The following changes shall be made to tHerlRCuse as part of this code:
1. [ Add the following definitions to Section R202 to read:

Air-impermeable insulation. An insulation having an air permanence equal to or less than OAL%S Pa pressure
differential tested according to ASTM E21@BE283.

Subsoil drain. A drain that collects subsurface water or seepage water and conveys such water to a place of disposal.

2. Change the definition of "Story above grade" in Section R202 to read:

Story above grade. Any story having its finished fleorface entirely above grade, except that a basement shall be
considered as a story above grade where the finished surface of the floor above the basement meets any one of

following:
1. Is more than 6 feet (1829 mm) above the grade plane.

2. Is more thn 6 feet (1829 mm) above the finished ground level for more than 50% of the total building perimeter.

3. Is more than 12 feet (3658 mm) above the finished ground level at any point.
3.] Change Section R301.2.1 to read:

R301.2.1 Wind limitations. Buildirgand portions thereof shall be limited by wind speed, as defined in Figure R301.2(1),
and construction methods in accordance with this code. Basic wind speeds shall be determined from Table R301.2|
Where different construction methods and structuraenas are used for various portions of a building, the applicable
requirements of this section for each portion shall apply. Where loadgafbcoverings, curtain walls, roof coverings,
exterior windows, skylights garage doorand exterior doors areoh otherwise specified, the loads listed in Table
R301.2(2) adjusted for height and expospeeusingTable R301.2(3)shall be used to determine design load performance

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

27



Regulations

requirements fowall coverings, curtain walls, roof coverings, extengindows skyights, garage doorand exterior
doors.Asphalt shingles shall be designed for wind speeds in accordance with Section RYm@ .§peeds for localities

in special wind regions, near mountainous terrain, and near gorges shall be based on elevaticat. A0S0 feet in
elevation or higher shall use 110 V mph (48.4 m/s) and areas under 4,000 feet in elevation shall use 90 V mph (39.6 m/s).
Gorge areas shall be based on the highest recorded speed per Iocallty or |n accordance with Iocal jurlsdremnentequ
determined in accordance with Section 6.5.4 of ASCBAR

in-Section-R905.

4. [ 4. Change Section R301.2.1.1 to read:

R301.2.1.1 Design criteria. Construction in regions where the basic wind speeds from Figure R301.2(4) equal or exceed
110 miles per hour (49 m/s) shall be designed in accoedaith one of the following:

1. American Forest and Paper Association (AF&PA) Wood Frame Construction Manual fera@helweFamily
Dwellings (WFCM);

2. Southern Building Code Congress International Standard for Hurricane Resistant Residential @on&Si€D 10);

3. Minimum Design Loads for Buildings and Other Structures (ASECHr

4. American Iron and Steel Institute (AISI), Standard for Feddmed Steel FraminBrescriptive Method for Oreand
Two-Family Dwellings (COFS/PM) with Supplement ta8tlard for ColeFormed Steel FramirBrescriptive Method for
One and TweFamily Dwellings.

Concrete construction shall be designed in accordance with the provisions of this code.
5. Change Table R301.7 to read:

Table R301.7

Allowable Deflection of Structial Member&®®¢
Structural Member Allowable Deflection
Rafters having slopes greater than 3/12 with no L/180
finished ceiling attached to rafters
Interior walls and partitions H/180
Floors and plastered ceilings L/360
All other structural members L/240
Exterior walls with plaster or stucco finish H/360
Exterior wall$ wind load$§ with brittle finishes H/240
Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

28



Regulations

Exterior wallg wind load$ with flexible finishes H/12d!

Veneer masonry walls L/600

Note: L = span length, H = span height.

*The wind load Ball be permitted to be taken as 0.7 times the Component and Cladding loads for th
purpose of determining deflection limits herein.

®For cantilever members, L shall be taken as twice the length of the cantilever.

°For aluminum structural members or panedsd in roofs or walls of sunroom additions or patio cover
not supporting edge of glass or sandwich panels, the total load deflection shall not exceed L/60. Fq
sandwich panels used in roofs or walls of sunroom additions or patio covers, the totkfleaiion
shall not exceed L/120.

YDeflection for exterior walls with interior gypsum board finish shall be limited to an allowable defle
of H/180.

6. Change Section R302.1 to read:

R302.1 Exterior walls. Construction, projections, openings andtiagioas of exterior walls of dwellings and accessory
buildings shall comply with Table R302.1.
Exceptions:

1. Walls, projections, openings or penetrations in walls perpendicular to the line use to determine the fire separati
distance.

2. Wallls of dwellhgs and accessory structures located on the same lot.

3. Detached tool sheds and storage sheds, playhouses and similar structures exempted from permits are not require
provide wall protection based on location on the Iot. Projections beyond the ewtaltishall not extend over the lot line.

4. Detached garages accessory to a dwelling located within two feet (610 mm) of a lot line are permitted to have roof ec
projections not exceeding four inches (102 mm).

5. Foundation vents installed in complianeith this code are permitted.
2 7.] Add an exception to Section R303.8 to read:

Exception: Seasonal structures not used as a primary residence for more than 90 days per year, unless rented, leased
on terms expressed or implied to furnish heaa)lsot be required to comply with this section.

5.[3:8.] Add Section R303.8.1 to read:

R303.8.1 Nonowner occupied required heating. Every dwelling unit or portion thereof which is to be rented, leased or |
on terms either expressed or implied tmfgh heat to the occupants thereof shall be provided with facilities in accordance
with Section R303.8 during the period from October 15 to May 1.

6.[ 4:9.] Add Section R303.9 to read:

R303.9 Insect screens. Every door, window and other outside openqjuiged for ventilation purposes shall be supplied
with approved tightly fitted screens of not less than 16 mesh peflifamesh per 25 mnand everyswingingscreerdoor
used for insect contrahall have a selflosing device.

#[5:10.] Add Secton R306.5 to read:

R306.5 Water supply sources and sewage disposal systems. The water and drainage system of any building or pren
where plumbing fixtures are installed shall be connected to a public or private water supply and a public or private sew
system. MWhere-applicabléds provided for in Section 103.11 for functional desjgwater supply sources and sewage

disposal systemsghal-beare] regulated [and approved by the Virginia Department of Healthahd the Virginia
Department of Envinemental Quality].

[ Note: See also the Memorandums of Agreement in the "Related Laws Package,” which is available from the Virgin
Department of Housing and Community Developmgnt.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

29



Regulations

8.[ 6:11.] Change Section R310.1 to read:

R310.1 Emergency escapedanescue required. Basements and each sleeping room designated on the construction
documents shall have at least one openable emergency escape and rescue opening. Such opening shall be directly to the
exterior of the building or to a deck, screen porckgress court, all of which shall provide access to a public street, public

alley or yard. Where emergency escape and rescue openings are provided, they shall have a sill height of not more than 44
inches (1118 mm) above the floor. Where a door openingngavihreshold below the adjacent ground elevation serves as

an emergency escape and rescue opening and is provided with a bulkhead enclosure, the bulkhead enclosure shall comply
with Section R310.3. The net clear opening dimensions required by thissgltéith be obtained by the normal operation

of the emergency escape and rescue opening from the inside, exceptdiaititemovable sash designed windows shall

be permitted to be used. Emergency escape and rescue openings with a finished heighe lzelmeent ground elevation

shall be provided with a window well in accordance with Section R310.2.

Exceptions:

1. Dwelling units equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with NFPA 13,
13R or 13D.

2. Basemets used only to house mechanical equipment and not exceeding total floor area of 200 square feé).(18.58 m
9.[ £ 12.] Change Section R310.1.1 to read:

R310.1.1 Minimum opening area. All emergency escape and rescue openings shall have a mininean otrihg of
5.7 square feet (0.530%mnincluding the tilting or removal of the sash as the normal operation to comply with sections
R310.1.2 and R310.1.3.

Exception: Grade floor openings shall have a minimum net clear opening of 5 square feet {0.465 m

12.[ 8:13.] Change Section R311.5.3.1 to read:

R311.5.3.1 Riser height. The mexim riser height shall be B4 inches (210 mm). The riser shall be measured vertically
between the leading edges of the adjacent treads. The greatest riser height within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the
smallest by more than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm).

43:[ 9:14.] Change Section R311.5.3.2 to read:

R311.5.3.2 Tread depth. The minimum tread depth shall be 9 inches (229 mm). The tread depth shall be measured
horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of adjacent treads anghataagie to the tread's

leading edge. The greatest tread depth within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch (9.5
mm). Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 10 inches (254 mm) measured as above at agluist (BDD

mm) from the side where the treads are narrower. Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 6 inches (152 mm) at
any point. Within any flight of stairs, the greatest winder tread depth at the 12 inch (305 mm) walk line shall not exceed th
smallest by more than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm).

214.[ 16.15.] Change Section R311.5.5 to read:

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

30



Regulations

R311.5.5 Stairway walking surface. The walking surface of treads and landings of stairways shall be level or sloped
steeper than one unit vertical in 48 incheszontal (twepercent slope).

17.[ 16. Change Section R317.1 to read:

R317.1 Twefamily dwellings. Dwelling units in twdamily dwellings shall be sepated from each other by wall and/or
floor assemblies having not less than-holir fireresistance rating when tested in accordance with ASTM E119. Fire
resistanceated floorceiling and wall assemblies shall extend to and be tight against the extalticairnvd wall assemblies

shall extend to and be tight against the underside of the roof sheathing. Dwelling unit separation wall assemblies, which
constructed on a lot line, shall be constructed as required in Section R317.1 for townhouses.

Exceptions:

1. A fire-resistance rating of 1/2 hour shall be permitted in buildings located entirely on the same lot and equippe
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with NFPA 13.

2. For twoefamily dwellings located on the same laiall assemblies need not extend through attic spaces when the ceiling
is protected by not less than 5fh (15.9 mm) Type X gypsum board and an attic draft stop constructed as specified in
Section R502.12.1 is provided above and along the wall assempéraging the dwellings. The structural framing
supporting the ceiling shall also be protected by not less thandd212.7 mm) gypsum board or equivalent.

41.17.] Add SectionR324R325RadonResistant Construction.
18.[22.18.] Add SectionR324-1R325.1to read:

R324-1R325.1Local enforcement of radon requirements. Following official action under Article 7 (8PBQ@ et seq.) of
Chapter 22 of Title 15.2 of the Code of Virginia by a locality in areas of high radon potential, as indicated byZdine 1
U.S. EPA Map of Radon Zones (IRC Figure AF101), such locality shall enforce the provisions contained in Appendix F.

Exemption: Buildings or portions thereof with crawl space foundations which are ventilated to the exterior, shall not b
required toprovide radorresistant construction.

49.[ 43:19.] Add SectionR325R326 Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs.
20-.[ 4-20.] Add SectionR325-1R326.1to read:

R325-1R326.1Use of Appendix G for swimming pools, spas and hot tubs. In addition to gihkcable provisions of
this code, swimming pools, spas and hot tubs shall comply with the provisions in Appendix G.

2% [ 15.21.] Add SectionR326R327Patio Covers.
22.[ 16.22.] Add SectionR326-1R327.1to read:
R326-1R327.1Use of Appendix H fopatio covers. Patio covers shall comply with the provisions in Appendix H.
23.[ ££23.] Add SectionR327R328Sound Transmission.
24.[ 18.24.] Add SectionR32741R328.1to read:

R32741 R328.1 Sound transmission between dwelling units. Constructiserablies separating dwelling units shall
provide airborne sound insulation as required in Appendix K.

25.[ 19.25.] Add SectionR327%2R328.2to read:

R327-2R328.2Airport noise attenuation. This section applies to the construction of the extericopneéldetached one
and twefamily dwellings and multiple singt&amily dwellings (townhouses) not more than three stories high with separate

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

31



Regulations

means or egress within airport noise zones when enforced by a locality pursuant {82884 the Code of Viligia.
The exterior envelope of such structures shall comply with Section 1207.4 of the state amendments to the IBC.

26.[ 20.26.] Change Section R401.4 to read:

R401.4 Soil tests. lh-areas—proven-bWhere] quantifiable data created by sound soil scemethodologies tp-have
indicate] expansive, compressible, shifting or unknown soil characteristios ljkely to be preseiit the building official
shall determine whether to require a soil test to determine the soil's characteristics at ampladeion. This test shall be
made by an approved agency using an approved method.

2+ [ 2% 27.] Change Section R403.1 to read:

R403.1 General. All exterior walls shall be supported on continuous solid or fully grouted masonry or concrete footings,
wood foundations, or other approved structural systems which shall be of sufficient design to accommodate all loads
according to Section R301 and to transmit the resulting loads to the soil within the limitations as determined from the
character of the soiFootings shall be supported on undisturbed natural soils or engineered fill.

Exception: Onestory detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar uses, not
exceeding 256 square feet (23.7822 af building area, provied all of the following conditions are met:

1. The building [eave] height is [potmerethan-120] feet [or lesg].
2. The maximum height from the finished floor level to grade does not exceed 18 inches.

3. The supporting structural elements in diremhtact with the ground shall be placed level on firm soil and when such
elements are wood they shall be approved pressure preservative treated suitable for ground contact use.

4. The structure is anchored to withstand wind loads as required by this code.

5. The structure shall be of ligframe construction whose vertical and horizontal structural elements are primarily formed
by a system of repetitive wood or light gauge steel framing members, with walls and roof of light weight material, not
slate, tile brick or masonry.

[ 22.28.] Change Section R404.1 to read as follows and delete Tables R404.1(1), R404.1(2) and R404.1(3):

R404.1 Concrete and masonry foundation walls. Concrete and masonry foundation walls shall be selected and constructed
in_accordane with the provisions of Section R404 or in accordance with ACI 318, ACI 332, NCMA -AR&8ACI
530/ASCE 5/TMS 402 or other approved structural standards.

28.[ 29. Change Section R408.1 to read:

R408.1 Ventilation. The unddioor space between the bt of the floor joists and the earth under any building (except
space occupied by a basement) shall have ventilation openings through foundation walls or exterior walls. The minimum
net area of ventilation openings shall not be less than one square .B82904) for each 150 square feet (14)nof
underfloor space area. One such ventilating opening shall be within three feet (914 mm) of each corner of the building.

Exception: When the exposed earth is covered with a continuous vapor barrier, the miménanea of ventilation
openings shall be not less than one square foot (0.09p®neach 1,500 square feet (139) mf underfloor space area.
Joints of the vapor retarder shall overlap by six inches (152 mm).

30. Change Section R408.2 to read:

R408.20penings for undefloor ventilation. Ventilation openings shall be covered for their height and width with any of
the following materials provided that the least dimension of the covering shall not exceed 1/4 inch (6.4 mm):

1. Perforated sheet metal gatnot less than 0.070 inch (1.8 mm) thick.

. Expanded sheet metal plates not less than 0.047 inch (1.2 mm) thick.

. Castiron grill or grating.

. Extruded loadbearing brick vents.

. Hardware cloth of 0.035 inch (0.89 mm) wire or heavier.

o o1 | WN

. Corrosiorresistant wire mesh, with the least dimension being 1/8 inch (3.2 mm).

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

32



Regulations

23:.31.] Add SectionR502.2-1-1R502.2.2.1t0 read:

R502.2.1.1R502.2.2.1Deck ledger connection to band joist. For residential applications and a total design load of 50 psf
the comection between a pressure preservative treated southern pine (or approveesistayt species) deck ledger and

a twoinch nominal band joist bearing on a sill plate or wall plate shall be constructed wittcli/fag screws or bolts

with washers pefableR502.2.1-1R502.2.2.1

29[ 24-32.] Add TableR562.-2:1-1R502.2.2.1t0 read:

TableR5622.1-1R502.2.2.1

Fastener Spacing for a Residential Southern Pine Deck Ledger andraMominal SolidSawn Band Joist (50 psf
total load§

Joist Span (ft) 6'and 6-1"to 8-1"to 10-1"to 12-1"to 141" to 16-1"to
less 8 10 12' 14 16' 18’

On-Center Spacing of Fasten&fs

1/2" x 4" Lag 30 23 18 15 13 11 10
Screvi®

1/2" Bolt with 36 36 34 29 24 21 19
washers

*The maximum gap between the fade¢h® ledger board and face of the house band joist shall be 1/2 inch.
®The tip of the lag screw shall fully extend beyond the inside face of the band joist.

‘Ledgers shall be flashed to prevent water from contacting the house band joist.

9 ag screws anddits shall be staggered as set out in Sed@562.2.1.1.R502.2.2.1.1

°Deck ledger shall be 2x8 PPT No. 2 Southern Pine (minimum) or other approved method and material as estg
by standard engineering practice.

30.[ 25.33.] Add SectionR502:21-11R502.2.2.1.%0 read:

R502.2.1.1.1R502.2.2.1.1Placement of lag screws or bolts in residential deck ledgers. The lag screws or bolts shall b
placed two inches in from the bottom or top of the deck ledgers and two inches in from the ends. Tieeviagrdoolts
shall be staggered from the top to the bottom along the horizontal run of the deck ledger.

3% [ 26.34.] Change Section R506.2.1 to read:

R506.2.1 Fill. Fill material shall be free of vegetation and foreign material and shall be natarglamic material that is

not susceptible to swelling when exposed to moisture. The fill shall be compacted to assure uniform support of the sl
and except where approved, the fill depth shall not exceed 24 inches (610 mm) for clean sand or granehasd 303

mm) for earth.

Exception: Material other than natural material may be used as fill material when accompanied by a certification from «
RDP and approved by the building official.

32.[ 2% 35.] Change Section R506.2.2 to read:

R506.2.2 Base. A-inch-thick (102 mm) base course consisting of clean graded sand, gravel or crushed stone passing a
inch (51 mm) sieve shall be placed on the prepared subgrade when the slab is below grade.

Exception: A base course is not required when the concretéssiadtalled on well drained or saigdavel mixture soils
classified as Group | according to the United Soil Classification System in accordance with Table R405.1. Material othi
than natural material may be used as base course material when accompantedtification from an RDP and approved

by the building official.

[ 28:.36.] Replace Section R602.10, including all subsections, with the following:

R602.10 Wall bracing. The use of this section is subject to the following clarification ofrefesmces:

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

33



Regulations

1. In Sections R301.2.2.1.1 and R301.2.2.4.1, delete the references to Table R602.10.1.

2. In Section R301.3, delete the exception to Item 1.

3. References to Table R602.10.1 in all other provisions of the IRC except those in Items 1 and 2 dbmecb@nces
to Table[ R602-10-1.R602.10.1.9 of this section.

4. In Section R403.1.6, delete the sentence that reads, "In Seismic Design Categdiesnd Dy, anchor bolts shall be
spaced at 6 feet (1829 mm) on center and located within 129r(@4 mm) of the ends of each plate section at interior
braced wall lines when required by Section R602.10.9 to be supported on a continuous foundation." In addition, all
references to Figure R602.10.5 in Section R403.1.6 shall be references to| R§@®210-4-1-2(1R602.10.3.3(1) of

this section.

5. Change the reference in Section R502.2.1 from Section R602.10.8 to Section R602.10.5 of this section.

All [e A - a ety Fuibings, additions and
conversiong shall be braced in accordance with thrs section. Where a burldrnq or portion thereof, does not comply with
one or more of the bracing requirements in this section, those portions shall be designed and constructeldnneacco
with [ aceepted-engineering-practittee International Building Code For structures in areas where the wind speed from
Table R301.2(1) is 110 mph or greater, an engineered design is requwed

e-of bracing
all methods

ce with
ind speed.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

34



Regulations

SBCC. <110mp
h ofa-threestory

EDITOR'S NOTE: Figures R602.10.1.3(1), R602.10.1.3(2), R602.10.1.4, R602.10.3.1, R602.10.32,10r4.1.2(1),
R602.10.4.1.2(2), R602.10.4.1.2(3), R602.10.4.1.2(4), R602.10.4.1.2(5) and R602.10.4.2 in this section were proposed as

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

35



Regulations

602.3(1) for
ener-spacing

e-R602.3(1).
accordance

@ |k
B [

Virginia Register of Regulations

36

Reg2Col.DOT



Regulations

eater tha

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

37



Regulations

&

10

Reg2Col.DOT

Virginia Register of Regulations

38




Regulations

ik
|
€18

:

§

:

8|
8|

|
|

|
&
i
&
@
&

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

39



Regulations

Fable R602.104.2
Length-of Portal Frame Braced-Wall Panel-for Gontinuous-Shedthing
Wall Height
g g 10 i 2
Length-of Portal Frame Braced " " " " "
Wall-Panel = = 20" 22 =

as follows:

hejoists at

all be

imibe of Sect

accepted

ired for the

g—wall bracing
nted-as the second

EDITOR'S NOTE: Figures R602.10.1.1, R602.10.1.3(1), R602.10.1.3(2), R602.10.1.4, R602.10.2.1(1), R602.10.2.1(2),
R602.10.3.1, R602.10.3.3(1), R602.10.3.3(2), R602.10.3.3(3), R602.10.3.3(4), R602.10.3.3(5), R602.10.5(1), R602.10.5(2) and
R602.10.6 belowhis note are new text in the final action.

R602.10.1 Braced wall lines. Braced wall lines shall be straight lines through the building plan at each level provided with
braced wall panels to resist lateral load. The percentage, location and construdiimeenf wall panels shall be as
specified in this section.

R602.10.1.1 Spacing of braced wall lines. In each story, spacing of parallel braced wall lines shall not exceed 50 feet (15
240 mm) as shown in Figure R602.10.1.1. When braced wall lines exceadiagsof 50 feet (15 240 mm), intermediate
braced wall line(s) shall be provided. Each end of a braced wall line shall intersect perpendicularly with other braced wall
lines or their projections.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

40



Regulations

C.
ANy
Braced wall line >
spaang = 50 feet -
) >
f "f
] C :
I’Q ” ~
WQ“cl?q » )
I 4
AN .

“ Note: If the distance between braced
wall lines A and C is greater than 50 feet,
then intermediate braced wall line B is
required.

For SI: 1 foot= 305 mm
Figure R602.10.1.1
Braced Wall Line Spacing

R602.10.1.2 Braced wall panels. Braced wall panels shall bédight sections of wall constructed along a braced wall
line to resist lateral loads in accordance with the intermittent bracing nse#pmtified in Section R602.10.2 or the
continuous sheathing methods specified in Section R602.10.3. Mixing of bracing methods shall be permitted as follows:

1. Mixing bracing methods from story to story shall be permitted.

2. Mixing bracing methods fromréaced wall line to braced wall line within a story shall be permitted, except that
continuous sheathing methods shall conform to the additional requirements of Section R602.10.3.

3. Mixing intermittent bracing methods along a braced wall line shall beitpednfor singlefamily dwellings in Seismic
Design Categories A, B and C and townhouses in Seismic Design Categories A and B. The required percentage of brac
for the braced wall line with mixed methods shall use the higher bracing percentage, p&t6Dabl.1.5, of all methods
used.

R602.10.1.3 Braced wall panel location. Braced wall panels shall be located at least every 25 feet (7620 mm) on center .
shall begin no more than 12.5 feet (3810 mm) from each end of a braced wall line or its prejgaimwn in Figure
R602.10.1.3(1) and Figure R602.10.4, but not less than the percentages given in Table R602.10.1.5. Braced wall lines v
continuous sheathing shall conform to the additional requirements of Section R602.10.3.3.

All braced wall panelshall be permitted to be offset eaf-plane from the designated braced wall line up to 4 feet (1219
mm) provided the total ottb-out offset in any braced wall line is not more than 8 feet (2438 mm) as shown in Figure

R602.10.1.3(2).

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

41



Regulations

o— $12.8' —= fo— $12.8' —=
} ;§i
| I
- Braced wall line 2 -
' | ' r“—‘“';:] T
o Do m“ o I
g o
“ ="
'
<
O
&
w
= braced wall ling 5 —— P
U -
o - =
- 2 f
3 -]
®
1 braced wirl panes d
i : o)
v
o
o~
“
acee wall
- Braced wall line 4 -
] - 1 2 9
- s25o0c. -
For SI: | foot = WS mm
Figere R602.10.1.3(1)
Braced Wall Panels snd Braced Wall Lines
Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

42




Regulations

y 8 feet total out-to-out offset
i (4 feet ecch way) in braced wall line.

) _I Breced wall line | 8 _ Braced wal fine
4 r
l— 4

Offsots in discontinuous braced wall line.

: Braced wall ine
‘ 4 \

Figure R602.10.1.3(2)
Offsets Permatted for Braced Wall
Panels Along a Braced Wall Line

R602.10.1.4 Angled walls. The walls of a bragell line shall be permitted to angle out of plane for a maximum diagonal
length of 8 feet (2438 mm). Where the angled wall occurs at a corner, the length of the braced wall line shall be measu
from the projected corner as shown in Figure R602.10.1her@v/the diagonal length is greater than 8 feet (2438 mm), it
shall be considered its own braced wall line.

HRACEDWALLLINE 1 -]
{/—PRU.ECTED CORNER
c -

NOTE: IF THE DIAGONAL WAL L IS GREATER

THAN 8 FEET LONG, THEN IT MUST BE TREATED
AS A SEPARATE BRACED WALL LINE.

|—.—BRICED WALLLINE 2—4—|

For ST: 1 foot =305 mm

Figure R602.10.14
Angled Comers

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

43



Regulations

R602.10.1.5 Minimum required pemtage of bracing. The minimum required percentage of bracing along each braced
wall line shall be in accordance with Table R602.10.1.5 and shall be the greater of that required by the Seismic Design
Cateqgory or the design wind speed.

Table R602.10.1%*
Minimum Required Percentage of Wall Bracing
Minimum Required Percentage of Fhkight Bracing per Wall
Line
Seismic d wall li i
Design Braced wall line spacing Braced wall line spacing greate
Desigr \ than 35and less than or equal
Category Floor less than or equal to 35 10 50"
SDC) or w oY
Wind Methods Methods
Speed WSP, CS All other WSP, CS All other
WSP, CS method§ WSP, CSG, method&
G, CSPF CSPF
Onestory
house or top
floor of a two 16% 16% 23% 23%
or threestory
house.
SDC A B First floor of a
or wind two-story or
speedO 1 0 second floor 16% 25% 23% 36%
mph of a three
story house.
First floor of a
threestory 25% 35% 36% 50%
house.
Onestory
house or top
floor of a two 16% 25% 23% 36%
or threestory
house.
SDC C or First floor of a
wind Sgeed two-story or
<110 mph second floor 30% 45% 43% 64%
of a three
story house.
First floor of a
threestory 45% 60% 64% 86%
house.
For SlI: 1 foot = 305 mm
®Foundation cripple wall panels shall be braced in accordance with Section R602.10.8.
PMethodsof bracing shall be as described in Sections R602.10.2 and R602.10.3.
“The total amount of bracing required for a given braced wall line shall be the product of the minimum required perce
and all the applicable adjustment factors described in Sedd602.10.4, R602.10.7 and R602.10.8.

Reg2Col.DOT

Virginia Register of Regulations

44




Regulations

YFor Method GB, the percentage required shall be doubled fesidad applications. |

R602.10.2 Intermittent bracing methods. Intermittent braced wall panels shall comply with this section. The location c
each panellwll be identified on the construction documents.

R602.10.2.1 Intermittent braced wall panels. Intermittent braced wall panels shall be constructed in accordance with one
the methods listed in Table R602.10.2.1.

Table R602.10.2.1
Intermittent Bracing M#hods
Method Material Minimum Thickness Figure Connection Criteria
1x4 wood or
- _--""-_'_‘-\_\_‘"-\—\_ .
Ll Letin-bracin approved metal Kmﬂmm'l Wood: 28d nail per stud
LIb Letin-pracing o o .
straps at 45° to 60 Metal: per manufacturer
angles T
Diagonal wood T —— ) L1 jon " A
DWB board at 24" 5/8" ‘ 2-8d (21/2" x 0.1"13 ) nails or 2
= —_——= staples, 13/4" per stud
spacing | — —
6d common (2" x 0.113" nails af
6" spacing (panel edges) and 4
- > 12" spacing (intermediate
WSP %ﬂ 3/8" suppats) or 16 ga. x BB3/4"
pané . staples: at 3" spacing (panel
edges) at 6" spacing
(intermediate supports
1-1/2" galvanized roofing nails
Structural 1/2" or 25/32" for — or 8d common (A/2" x 0.113")
SFB fiberboard 16" stud spacing nails at 3" spacing (panel edged
sheathing only [ . at 6" spacing (intermediate
supports)
Nails at 7" spacing at panel
edges including top and bottom|
" plates: for exterior sheathing nai
GB Gypsum boar /2" - :
GB Gypsum board 12 size, see Table R602.3(1); for
i interior gypsum board nail size,
see Table R702.3.5
1-1/2" galvanized roofing nails
Particleboard 3/8" or 1/2" for 16" ok or .8d corwmon (ﬂlz x0.113")
PBS <heath stud Snacing onl ] ”Hm” | nails at 3" spacing (panel edges
sheating y [ B at6" spacing (intermediate
supports)
Portland cement g S 1-1/2", 11 gage, 7/16" head nail
PCP T plaster See Section R703.6 at 16" spacing or 7/16'16 gage
paste = staples at 6" spacing
Hardboard panel 0.092" dia., 0.225" head nails
n = m -
HPS 4‘3—90”” 7/16 | with length to accommodate 1
slding - = | 1/2" penetratia into studs at 4"
Alternate braced See Fig -
ernate brace ee Figure .
ABW wall R602.10.1(1) 1 \ See Figure R602.10.1(1)
Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

45



Regulations

Intermittent See Figure .
IPE portal frame R60210.1(2) See Figure R602.10.1(2)
For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 305 mm

PANEL LENGTH
SPECIFIED BY
TABLE R602.1022

"

- —
=

NN

N

FOR A PANEL SPLICE (IF
NEEDED), PANEL EDGES SHALL
BE BLOCKED. ONE ROW OF
TYP. SHEATHING-TO-FRAMING
NAILING IS REQUIRED

|~

MIN. 3/8" THICK
WOOD STRUCTURAL
PANELS ON ONE
FACE

MINIMUM DOUBLE

HEIGHT SPECIFIED 8Y TABLE R602.10.2.2

2X4 FRAMING, —— e

NN

c
B ——

Sh

AN

8d COMMON OR GALV. BOX

NAILS @ 4" 0.C. AT PANEL

EDGES

8d COMMON OR GALV
/_

BOX NALS @ 12" O.C. AT
INTERIOR SUPPORTS

STUDS REQURED :‘ : 'A_ eagf——— STUDS UNDER
(! A i HEADER AS
HOLD-DOWN i : REQUIRED
DEVICE ON EAW&E% /
SIDE WITH A N a3 "
MINMUM f / #4 TOP AND BOTTOM
CAPACITY OF s A
3600 LBS i H
' 4 gz 4 H
“. 5 L) f: i 4 'L.'
1/2" DIA. ANCHOR —— ) ST 12°X 12"
BOLTS BETWEEN 6° 3 31 Takit E MINIMUM
AND 12" FROM EACH |= == =e=.cmp == 9—— FOOTING SIZE
END OF PANEL . .
For SI 1 foot =305 mm, 1 mch=254 mm, 1 pownd =4 5N
Fagare R602.10.2.1(1)
Method ABW: Akernate Braced Wall Pagel
Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

46




Regulations

L EXTENT OF HEADER .
DOUBLE PORTAL FRAME (TWO BRACED WALL PANELS)
& EXTENT OF MEADER SHEATHING FILIR
SINGLE PORTAL FRAVE [ONE BRACED WALL PANEL) * 4— A ¥ NCEOED
T e VI 3" X 11.25° NET HEADER [ & :'_j; H
1.0 01§ resOmRSHALL OCCURAT TOP OF WALL © 4 e el 1
) ERA (STEEL MEADERS PROMIBITED) 8145 m
b g F01 - * o ;
b FASTEN TOP PLATE TO HEADER WITH TWO 100018 TYPICAL PORTAL - | I ‘1 100 ool
3] | ROWS OF 100 SINKER NALS AT 3 OC. TYP. STRAP FRAME N SINKERS, STRAP
KA x4 Y, I 2ROV B
b ! 000 LS STRAP OPPOSITE SHEATHNG 2 a yoc
K - FOR A PANEL GPUCE || a
b il FAGTEN GHEAATHING TOMEADER WITH 30 COMMONOR (F NEEDED), PANGL I o
i k1 GALVANIZED BOXNAILS IN 7" GRID PATTERN A SHOWNAND SHALL BE [{ J s
HEOHT - it 3°OC. N ALL FRAMING {BTUDS, BLOCKING AND BILLS) TYR BLOCKED AND OCCUR | - .
PECIPED - WATHIN 24° OF MID- - m"m““
VIASE I it UBNOTH SPRGPED BY HEGHT, ONE ROW OF |
RBO21922 °*° Xt TARLE R8C2.10.22 TYR SHEATHNG.TO.
iy > FRANING NALIG |1 1
- - 1S REQURED I || 4 <nLs
- - MIN 244 FRAMING SRANDKNR i Jd  nowoow
s %1 MIN (2 2X4 Bt el | 1 oevice
- ST MIN. THIOOESS WO NALED TOGETHER | -1
STRUCTURAL PANEL SHEATHING WITH 3-160 SINKERS . I <
MIN. 4200 LE BTRAP TYPE HOLD-OOWN DEVICE [EMBECOED
INTQ CONCRETE AND NALED INTO FRAMING). INGTALL PER I
Pniopil MIN. 1000 LB
‘ " MIN. 2 X 2° X 340" PLATE WASHER DEVICE : Ei|‘ =
X ONE 58" DIA ANCHOR BOLT WITH 7 NIN EMBEDMENT |
® ‘l FOUNDATION
\mmrmmw ‘ I o
RENFORCED WITH 84 RERAR TOP AND BOTTOM o« — A
FRONTELEVATION SECTION A-A
SIDLLLEVATION
For ST: 1 mch=254 mm, 1 foot=305 mm, 1 pound =45N
Figure R602.10.2.1(2)
Method IPF: Intermittent Portal Frame Braced Wall Panel

R602.10.2.2 Minimum length of intermittent braced wall panels. The minimum length ofireaahittent braced wall

panel shall comply with Table R602.10.2.2. For Methods DWB, WSP, SFB, GB, PBS, PCP and HPS, each panel sh

cover at least three studs where studs are spaced 16 inches (406 mm) on center or at least two studs where sdds are ¢

24 inches (610 mm) on center. Only those-hdlght braced wall panels complying with the length requirements of Table

R602.10.2.2(1) shall be permitted to contribute towards the minimum required percentage of bracing.

Exception: For Methods DWB, WSEBFB, PBS, PCP _and HPS, panel lengths less than the dimensions shown in Table

R602.10.2.2 shall be permitted provided the effective lengths in accordance with Table R602.10.2(2) are used in place

actual lengths when determining compliance with the pésgernof bracing required by Table R602.10.1.5.

Table R602.10.2.2(1)
Minimum Length of Intermittent Braced Wall Parféls

Height of Intermittent Braced Wall Panel
Bracing Method Floor
8 9 10’ 171 12
DWB, WSP, SFB,
GB°, PBS, PCP, All 48" 48" 48" 53" 58"
HPS
ABW All 28" 32" 34" 38" 42"
e Onestory house 16" 16" 16" 18" 20"
IPE A .
First floor of a twe 24" 24" 24" 27" 29"
story house
Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

47




Regulations

For Sl: 1 foot = 305 mm, 1 inch = 25.4 mm

4nterpolation shall be permitted.

®\When determining compliance with the percentage of bracing requirdiddg R602.10.1.5, the effective length of Metho
LIB shall be equivalent to 48" (1219 mm) provided it complies with the Table R602.10.2.1.

‘Gypsum board applied to both sides of the braced wall panel; where the gypsum board is applied to one gideedhe re
length shall be doubled.

Table R602.10.2(2)
Effective Lengths for Brace Wall Panels When Determining Percentage of Bracing

Actual Length of Braced Wall Height
Wall Panel g 9 10
48" 48" 48" 48"
42" 36" N/A N/A
36" 27" N/A N/A

For SI: 1inch = 25.4 mm

qnterpolation is permitted.

R602.10.2.3 Adhesive attachment of sheathing in Seismic Design Category C. Adhesive attachment of wall sheathing shall
not be permitted in Seismic Design Category C.

R602.10.3 Continuous sheathing methods. Bfaeall lines with continuous sheathing constructed in accordance with this
section shall be permitted.

R602.10.3.1 Continuous sheathing braced wall panels. Continuous sheathing methods require structural panel sheathing to
be used on all sheathable surfacd a braced wall line including areas above and below openings and gable end walls.
Braced wall panels shall be constructed in accordance with one of the methods listed in Table R602.10.3.1.

Table R602.10.3.1
Continuous Sheathing Methods
. Minimum . . L

Method Material Thickness Figure Connection Criteria
6d common (2" x 0.113")
nails at 6" spacing (panel
________ edges) ad at 12" spacing

" e e (intermediate supports) or 16
CSWSP Wood structural panel 3/8" I_I ﬂ i ga. x 13/4" staples: at 3"
spacing (panel edges) and 6
spacing (intermediate
supports)
Wood structural panel
CSG supporting roof load 3/8" See Method CSVSP
_— only adjacent garage =
openings
Continuous portal See Figure .
CSPP F— R602.10.3.1 See Figure R602.10.3.1
For SI: 1 inch =25.4 mm
Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

48



Regulations

®Applies to one wall of a garage only.

®The number of continuous portal frame panels in a braced wall line shall not exceed four. Continuous portal frame p
shall not be stacked vertically multi-story buildings.

OUTSIDE ELEVATION SIDE ELEVATION
N EXTENT OF HEADER (TWO BRACED WALL SEGMENTS) .
- EXTENT OF HEADER (ONE BRACED WALL SEGNENT)
H : i MIN. 3" X 1114° NET MEADER; i “
3 HEADER SHALL OCCUR AT TOP OF WALL i §e- Mt
R | (STEEL HEADERS PROHIBITED) : RS
D 3 Z'TO W (FINISHED VAOTH) + % 3 0GR
g 1 FASTEN SHEATHING TO HEADER WITH 80 COMMON g: g 1 NALES IN 2 ROWS
£2 3 NALS IN 3 GRID PATTERN AS SHOWN AND 3 OC. N : & 2 @y oc
A AL FRAMING (STUDS ANO SILLS) TYP. f 5 ; :
*%. " MEADER SHALL BE FASTENED TO THE : UNEWITY | ¢ . 1000 L8 HEADER-
2 27 L KNG STUD WITH 6-950 SINKER NALS CONTINUOUS © ~ 2| TO-JACK-STUD STRAP
o ] N : SHEATHING | | w4 ON BOTH SDES
ey - “1 7 4000 L8 HEADERTO-JACK-STUD STRAP ON BOTH SI0ES L " O OPEING
BASED ON > ©1 OF OPENING (INSTALL ON BACKSDE AS SHOWN ON b i
TWBE o SIEELEVATION) , 2
s e 12 3 FOR A PANEL SPLICE (F NEEDED) PANEL FDGES SHALL BE ¢ e
b <4 BLOCKED AND OCCUR WITHIN 24' OF MID-HEIGHT, ONE » - 8" MIN
- “ ROW OF TYP. SHEATHING-TO-FRAMING NAILING IS REQUIRED NO. OF » THICINESS WO00
e . INEACHPANEL : J:g:?nms k 4 STRUCTURAL PANEL
o 7 W000 STRUCTURAL PANEL STRENGTH AXIS i A w“m‘m e 1 SHEATHING
Y e e [ L i
e “7LENGTH BASED ON TABLE R021032 & B
i ‘-I._.I. 1 .I..I. T‘
4 -1 |
ANCHOR BOLTS PER R403.1.6 TYP.
MIN. Z X 7 X 316" PLATE WASHER
4
o NAIL SOLE PLATE /& NAR SOLE
1 T TO JOST PER \ ! < PLATE TO JOST
o " FRAMING ANCHORS TABLE RO023(1) e o PERTABLE
¥ # soLe 4 ) » 4 ) REOZ.31)
. g LB S B {
R e
=8
\ { 1 Pl =N
WOOO STRUCTURAL PANEL SHEATHING OVER APPROVED BAND JOIST . ’ BAD A 'ow" =
OVER RAISED WOOD FLOOR OR SECOND FLOOR ~ FRAMING ANCHOR OPTION
' 4 -y~ ~e -
" NAIL SOLE FLATE s ~ NAIL SOLE
— e e TO XXST PER \ 2 PLATE TO JOIST
popmpint |1 . — 80 COMMON NARLS TABLE R6G23(1) \ < - ! PERTABLE
M,M o 0/ ¥ 0C.TOPAND BOTTOM \ 2 2 [ RED2XY)
| — BERERES - KRR E =
! i
» b 4 RS
WOOD STRUCTURAL PANEL SHEATHING OVER APPROVED BAND JOIST | R} S oo
OVER RAISED WOOD FLOOR Ok SECOND FLOOR ~ WOOD STRUCTURAL PANEL OVERLAP OPTION
For ST: 1inch = 25.4 men, 1 foot =305 mm, 1 pound =45 N NOTIOSCALR
Figare R602.10.3.1
Method CS-PF: Continuous Portal Frame Braced Wall Panels

R602.10.3.2 Length of braced wall panels with continuous sheathing. Braced wall panels along a braced wall line wi
continuous sheathing shall be fakight with a length based on the adjacent clear opening height in accordance with Table
R602.10.3.2. Where a panel has an opening on either side of differing heights, the taller opening shall govern wh
determining thepanel length from Table R602.10.3.2. Only thoseigiight braced wall panels complying with the length

requirements of Table R602.10.3.2 shall be permitted to contribute towards the minimum required percentage of braci

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

49



Regulations

per Table R602.10.1.5. For Meth@ SPF, wall height shall be measured from the top of the header to the bottom of the
bottom plate as shown in Figure R602.10.4.3.1.

Table R602.10.3.2
Length Requirements for Braced Wall Panels In a Braced Wall Line with Continuous Stfeathin
Method Adjacent Clear Wall Height
Opening Height g 9 10 11" 12"
CSWSP 64" 24" 27" 30" 33" 36"
76" 29" 30" 30" 33" 36"
80" 31" 33" 30" 33" 36"
84" 35" 36" 33" 36" 36"
88" 39" 39" 36" 38" 36"
92" 44" 42" 39" 41" 36"
96" 48" 45" 42" 43" 39"
128" 63" 61"
132 66" 64"
136" 66"
140" 69"
144" 72"
CSG 0120" 36"
CSPF 0120" 24"
For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 305 mm
4nterpolation is permitted.

R602.10.3.3 Braced wall panel location and corner constructiorh&iglht wall paels complying with the length
requirements of Table R602.10.3.2 shall be located at each end of a braced wall line with continuous sheathing and at least
every 25 feet (7620 mm) on center.

A minimum 24 inch (610 mm) wood structural panel corner returh lsbagrovided at both ends of a braced wall line with
continuous sheathing in accordance with Figures R602.10.3.3(1) and R602.10.3.3(2). In lieu of the corner retdrn, a hold

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

50



Regulations

down device with a minimum uplift design value of 800 Ib (3560 N) shall be fedténthe corner stud and to the
foundation or framing below in accordance with Figure R602.10.3.3(3).

Exception: The first braced wall panel shall be permitted to begin 12.5 feet (3810 mm) from each end of the braced w
line provided one of the followimis satisfied:

1. A minimum 24 inch (610 mm) long, fufleight wood structural panel is provided at both sides of a corner constructed in
accordance with Figures R602.10.3.3(1) and R602.10.3.3(4); or

2. The braced wall panel closest to the corner sha# heholddown device with a minimum uplift design value of 800 Ib

(3560 N) fastened to the stud at the edge of the braced wall panel closest to the corner and to the foundation or fram
below in accordance with Figure R602.10.3.3(5).

| 8d common (0 131" x onentation of studs
212)@6"ac nal may vary, see Figure
paned eoges RE02 ¥2) J

)

L

MNETUM 24" WOOd e

structural paned
sheathmg
10d nasl (0.131" x
MZY@1270cC
84 common (0.131%x
2127@ 6" oc onal
panel edges
ogtional non-structural
fiber panel

orentation of Suds may
vary, see Figure R802 3(2)

gypsum wall board as requined
andinstalled in accordance wi

minimum 24" wood

braced wall ine with

continuous sheathing
84 common (0131 x
2127 @12 o.c.onall
intermedate sepponts

10d nat (0 1917 x —
M2Y@ 12%0c

n\

83 common nais (01317

structural panel sheathsng

_traced wall Ine with

x2VZ)@6"oc onal
pands’ edges

8d common nails (0 131" x
212 at 6" oc, onall

continuous sheathing

; " 8d common (0.131"x 2-1/2%) A"
PURES: WS @ 12" 0.C.on ¥l Itermediate -
supports
(o) Outside corner detail (b) Inside comner detall
T
SR 8d common nails (0.131" x 2-127)

Oypsum wall board as requited and ——e @6 o.c on all panels' edges

nstalled n accordance with Chapter 7

et UMM 24" wood

16dnad (D 1317 1 3.1/7") e sructural panel sheathing

2rows @24 oc

Tmnmm 24" wood
\

structural panel sheathing —8d common (0131 1 2-1/27 typical @ 6°

\ / o.c atpanel eages and 2 12° o c on all
‘\ avpsum wall board -\ intermediate supports
;.8 s Xm,ﬁww Uik
filer panel
8d common nad (0 131" x J

2127 @ 3 o.c. on bath
studs at each panel edge

S

optional blocking for
braced wall Ime with

CONINUOUS Sheating

For ST 1 mch= 254 men, 1 foot = 305 mm

Figare R602.10.3.3(1)
Typical Exterior Corer Framing for Continons Sheathing

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

51



Regulations

CONTINUQUSLY SHEATHED BRACED WALL LINE
(ALL FRAMED PORTIONS OF WALL ARE SHEATHED)

CORNER DETAIL PER FIGURE R602.10.3.3(1)

772777777

w5 X

/I
Za N

RRRHIN
B
.

| |

N

R

S

NS

NN

7 /
VA ‘ / [} ol
MINIMUM 24" :
ggsg:l\? BRACED WALL PANEL AT BRACED WALL PANEL
BANEL END OF BRACED WALL LINE DETERMINED BY
AS DETERMINED BY SECTION R602.10.3.2
SECTION R602.10.3.2
For ST 1 foot = 305 mm
Figure R602.10.3.3(2)

Braced Wall Line with Continous Sheathing with Comer Return Panel

N\ SR R
7727222 777

i mmm |y

J i VX

/ é..-/ﬁ' ==

)
(77 A

=

NI

800lb HOLD-DOWN
DEVICE IN LEU OF BRACED WALL PANEL AT BRACED WALL PANEL
CORNER RETURN END OF BRACED WALL LINE DETERMINED BY

AS DETERMINED BY SECTION R60210.3.2
SECTION R802.10.3.2

For ST 1 foot =305 mm, 1 pound =445 N

Fagure R602.10.3.3(3)
Braced Wall Lne with Continuous Sheathing without Comer Return Panel

¥

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

52



Regulations

CONTINUQUSLY SHEATHED BRACED WALL LINE
(ALL FRAMED PORTIONS OF WALL ARE SHEATHED)

\ = 12-6" MAX.
~ CORNER DETAIL PER
FIGURE R602 10.3.3(1)

= AT

o

e

/ X
TP / ) /// f / %/

NNNNS

II
|
\\\\

\

c\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\

\\\\\‘

PANEL AT

BOTH SIDES BRACED WALL PANEL AWAY BRACED WALL PANEL

OF CORNER FROM END OF BRACED WALL DETERMINED BY
LINEAS DETERMINED BY SECTION R602.10.3.2
SECTION R602.10.3.2

For ST 1 foot = 305 mm
Figure R602.10.3.3(4)

Braced Wall Line with Continnous Sheathing - First Braced Wall Pagel
Awray From End of Wall Line Without Hold-Down

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

53



Regulations

CONTINUQUSLY SHEATHED BRACED WALL LINE
(ALL FRAMED PORTIONS OF WALL ARE SHEATHED)

12-6" MAX.

|

P

ey

_—
NN
N N

N
NN
NN
N
N
\\\
\\
\\\
\\\
N\
NN
NN
N
N
N\
N
N\
N\
N
NN
N\
\\
N
NN

Y

OO
\

N\
RN
NN\ N

\
N

RN
L
—
P—

O\ \

\\ s\

R
N\

\ \

\

SNONN N

/A
A S SKXS 7 '/
//,v/_’/ /:;/;/;j//i////;///
7 R
800/b HOLD-DOWN

DEVICE IN UEU OF BRACED WALL PANEL AWAY

CORNER RETURN FROM END OF BRACED WALL
LINE AS DETERMINED BY
SECTION R602.10.3.2

For ST 1 foot =305 mm, 1 pound =445 N

Figure R602.10.3.3(5)
Braced Wall Line with Continuous Sheathing - First Braced Wall Panel
Away From End of Wall Line With Hold-Down

R602.10.4 Braced wall panel finish material. Braced wall panels shall havech/#hick gypsum board installed on the
side of the wall opposite the bracing material and fastened in accordance with TablegR702.3.

Exceptions:
1. Braced wall panels that are constructed in accordance with Methods GB, ABW, IPF-BRd CS

2. When an approved interior finish material with aiplane shear resistance equivalent to gypsum board is installed.

3. For Methods DWB, WSP, 8 PBS, PCP, and HPS, interior gypsum board may be partially or entirely omitted
provided the minimum required percentage of bracing in Table R602.10.1.5 is multiplied by an adjustment factor of 1.5.

R602.10.5 Braced wall panel connections. Braced waklsashall be connected to floor/ceiling framing or foundations as
follows:

1. Where framing is perpendicular to a braced wall panel above or below, a rim joist or blocking shall be provided along
the entire length of the braced wall panel in accordande migture R602.10.5(1). Fastening of wall plates to framing, rim
joist or blocking shall be in accordance with Table R602.3(1).

2. Where framing is parallel to a braced wall panel above or below, a rim joist, end joist or other parallel framing member
shall be provided directly above and below the panel in accordance with Figure R602.10.5(2). Where a parallel framing
member cannot be located directly above and below the panedeftth blocking at 16 inch (406 mm) spacing shall be
provided between the pdlel framing members to each side of the braced wall panel in accordance with Figure
R602.10.5(2). Fastening of blocking and wall plates shall be in accordance with Table R602.3(1).

3. Connections of braced wall panels to concrete or masonry shall bmmdawce with Section R403.1.6.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

54



Regulations

CONTINUOUS FULL HEIGHT BLOCKING
RIM JOIST CONTINUOUS ALONG LENGTH
OF BRACED WALL PANEL

PERPENDICULAR FRAMING

8d @ 6" 0.C. ALONG
—~ BRACED WALL PANEL

=s— BRACED WALL PANEL

3-16d @ 16" O.C. ALONG
BRACED WALL PANEL

A\

——

8d @ 6" 0.C. ALONG
BRACED WALL PANEL

~— BRACED WALL PANEL

-

3-16d @ 16" 0.C. ALONG
BRACED WALL PANEL

PERPENDICULAR FRAMING

For ST 1mnch =254 mm
Figure R602.10.5(1)

\CON‘HNUOUS FULL HEIGHT BLOCKING A

RIM JOIST CONTINUOQUS ALONG LENGTH
OF BRACED WALL PANEL

Braced Wall Panel Connection When Perpendicular to Floor/Ceiling Frammg

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

55



Regulations

ADDITIONAL FRAMING
MEMBER DIRECTLY ABOVE
BRACED WALL PANEL

~CONTINUOUS RIMOR

/  ENDJOIST /

—~ FULL HEIGHT BLOCKING

/ @ 16" 0.C. ALONG

BRACED WALL PANEL

{ !

~3.18d @ 16° 0.C. ALONG
BRACED WALL PANEL

~3-16d @ 16" 0.C. ALONG
/ BRACED WALL PANEL

g

2

\

\ \-8d @6"0.C. ALONG “\_TOE NAIL 3.8d
“—Bd @ 6° 0.C. ALONG BRACED WALL PANEL NAILS AT EACH
BRACED WALL PANEL BLOCKING
- L |~ MEMBER
= = AT
et— BRACED WALL PANEL et— BRACED WALL PANEL Let— BRACED WALL PANEL

~3-16d AT EACH
/ BLOCKING MEMBER

eyt

i

TN CONTINUOUS RIM
OR END JOIST

-

\
\_ ADDITIONAL FRAMING
MEMBER DIRECTLY BELOW
BRACED WALL PANEL

For SI 1 mch =254 mm

Figare R602.10.5Q2)
Braced Wall Panel Coanection When Parallel to Floor/Ceiing Framing

N

“~ FULL HEIGHT

é-'lﬁd NAILS
EACH SIDE

BLOCKNG @ ¥6°0.C
ALONG BRACED WALL
PANEL

R602.10.6 Braced wall panel support. Braced wall panels shall be supported as follows:

1. Braced wall panels shall be permitted to be supported on cantilevered floor joists meeting the cantilever limits of Sectio

R502.3.3 provided joists are blockatlithe nearest bearing wall location.

2. Elevated post or pier foundations supporting braced wall panels shall be designed in accordance with accepted

engineering practice.

3. Masonry stem walls supporting braced wall panels with a length

of 48 inci&k itikR) or less shall be reinforced in

accordance with Figure R602.10.6. Masonry stem walls supporting

braced wall panels with a length greater than 48 inches

(1220 mm) shall be constructed in accordance with Section R403

.1. Braced wall panels constracteddance with

Methods ABW and IPF shall not be permitted to attach to masonry stem walls.

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

56




Regulations

R602.10.7 Panel joints. All vertical joints bfaced wall panel sheathing shall occur over and be fastened to common
studs. Horizontal joints in braced wall panels shall occur over and be fastened to common blocking of a mifiighum 1
inch (38 mm) thickness. Panel joints for Method IPF shall be amistt in accordance with Figure R602.10.2.1(2). Panel
joints for Method CSPF shall be constructed in accordance with Figure R602.10.3.1.

Exception: Blocking at horizontal joints shall not be required in braced wall panels constructed using MethodsBVSP, SF
GB, PBS or HPS where the percentage of bracing required by Table R602.10.1.5 is multiplied by an adjustment factor
2.0.

R602.10.8 Cripple wall bracing. Cripple walls shall be braced with a percentage and type of bracing as required for tl
wall abovein accordance with Table R602.10.1.5 with the following modifications for cripple wall bracing:

1. The bracing percentage as determined from Table R602.10.1.5 shall be multiplied by an adjustment factor of 1.15, an
2. The wall panel spacing shall be d=aged from 25 feet (7620 mm) to 18 feet (5486 mm).

Reg2Col.DOT Virginia Register of Regulations

57



